
25 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 35 SRR 77(1), Bangalore, dated 8th February 1978 
In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of 
India, 
read with the Order of the President of India No. G.S.R. 799(E), dated 31st December, 
1977, the 
Governor of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules further to amend the Karnataka 
Civil 
Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 namely:- 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Amendment) Rules, 1978. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Substitution of new rule for rule 12.- For rule 12 of the Karnataka Civil Services 
(General 
Recruitment) Rules, 1977, the following shall be substituted, namely:- 
“12. Conditions relating to Physical Fitness.- (1) No candidate selected for 
appointment in accordance with the provisions of clause (1) of rule 4 shall be appointed 
to 
any post in the State Civil Services unless he satisfies the appointing authority that he is 
physically fit to discharge the duties that he may be called upon to perform. Government 
may by order prescribe the physical standards required to be satisfied by a person for 
appointment to any service or post and specify the medical authority which may grant 
the 
certificate of physical fitness and provide for such other incidential matters as may be 
necessary. The opinion of the Medical authority, regarding the physical fitness or 
otherwise 
of the candidate shall be binding on the candidate. 
(2) Government may, in any case, for good and sufficient reasons, dispense with the 
production of the Certificate under sub-rule (1). 
(3) The appointing authority may, in the case of persons appointed temporarily in short 
vacancies of less than three months duration, dispense with production of the certificate 
under sub-rule(1)” 
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA, 
By Order and in the name of the 
President of India, 
B.B. BAJENTRI, 
Under Secretary to Government, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 23-2-1978 
26 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 20 SRR 78, Bangalore, Dated 19th July, 1978 
In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of 
India, 
the Governor of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules further to amend the 
Karnataka Civil 



Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 namely:- 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Second Amendment) Rules, 1978. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of rule 3.- After the proviso to rule 3 of the Karnataka Civil Services 
(General 
Recruitment) Rules, 1977, the following further proviso shall be inserted, namely:- 
“Provided further that no person shall be eligible for promotion unless he has 
satisfactorily 
completed the period of probation or officiation, as the case may be, in the post held by 
him”. 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
B.B. BAJENTRI, 
Under Secretary to Government, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 27-7-1978 
27 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 37 SSR 77, Bangalore, dated 8th February 1979 
In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of 
India, 
the Governor of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules further to amend the 
Karnataka Civil 
Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 namely:- 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Third Amendment) Rules, 1979. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of Rule 2.- In sub-rule (1) of the rule 2 of the Karnataka Civil Services 
(General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 (herein after referred to as the said rules) after 
clause (1) the 
following clause shall be inserted, namely:- 
“(ll) Physically handicapped candidate means a person.- 
(a) who suffers from,- 
(i) total absence of sight; or 
(ii) visual acquity not exceeding 6/60 or 20/200 (snellen) in the better eye with 
correcting lenses; or 
(iii) limitation of the field of vision subtending an angle of 20 degrees of worse; 
(b) In whom the sense of hearing is non-functional for the ordinary purpose of life or life 
or 
who does not hear and understand sounds at all events with amplified speech or having 
hearing loss of more than 90 decibles in the better ear (profound impairanment) or total 
loss hearing in both ears; or 
(c) who has physical defect or deformity which causes an interference with the normal 
functioning of the bones, muscles and joints;” 
3. Amendment of rule 6:- Explanation to sub-rule (3) of rule 6 of the said rules shall be 
omitted. 



4. Amendment of rule 9:- In rule 9 of the said rules,- 
(1) in the heading the words ‘and physically handicapped” shall be inserted at the end; 
(2) after sub-rule (1) the following sub-rule shall be inserted namley:- 
“(1A) Notwithstanding anything contained in the rules of recruitment specially made in 
respect of any service or post, if in such rules of recruitment direct recruitment is 
prescribed as 
one of the methods of recruitment, the percentage or number of vacancies set apart for 
that method 
shall be reduced by two percent...... such number as is equal to two percent of the 
vacancies in 
28 
addition to be vacancies to be reduced under sub-rule (1) and the percentage of number 
so reduced 
shall be filed by direct recruitment from among candidates who are physically 
handicapped; 
Provided that this sub-rule shall not be applicable to direct recruitment to,- 
(i) any Class I or Class II post: 
(ii) any post for appointment to which specific physical standards are prescribed in the 
rules 
of recruitment. 
(iii) the post of Drivers of Motor Vehicles; and 
(iv) such other posts as the Government may by order direct”. 
(3) in sub-rules (2) and (3) after the words, brackets and figure “sub-rule (1)” the words, 
brackets, 
letter and figure “and sub-rule (1A)” shall be inserted. 
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA, 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
B.B. BAJENTRI, 
Under Secretary to Government, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 22-7-1979 
29 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
NOTIFICATION 
NO. DPAR 33 SRR 78, Bangalore, Dated 19th July 1978 
In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of 
India, 
the Governor of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules further to amend the 
Karnataka Civil 
Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 namely:- 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Fourth Amendment) Rules, 1979. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of rule 2.- (1) In sub-rule (1) of rule 2 of the Karnataka Civil Services 
(General 
Recruitment) Rules, 1977 (hereinafter referred to as the said rules),- 
(1) for clause (d), the following clause shall be substituted,- 
“(d) “Backward Castes”, “Backward Communities” and “bakward Tribes” means 



the backward castes, the backward communities and the backward tribes as notified by 
Government in G.O.No. DPAR 1 SBC 77, dated 4th March, 1977.” 
(2) after clause (m) the following clause shall be inserted namely,- 
“(m) “Scheduled Castes, Scheduled Tribes” shall have the same meaning as in the 
Constitution of India. 
3. Amendment of Rule 6.- For sub-rule (1) and (2) of rule 6 of two rules the following 
subrules 
shall be substituted, namely:- 
“(1) Save as otherwise provided in the rules of recruitment specially made and 
applicable to 
any service or post .. secribing histle are limit, every canditate for appointment by direct 
recuritment 
must have attained the age of eighteen years and attained the age of, 
(a) thirty five years in the case of a person belonging to any of the Scheduled Castes or 
Scheduled Tribes or Backward Tribes; 
(b) thrity three yerars in the case of a person belonging to any of the Backward cases or 
backward communications; 
(c) thirty years in the case of any other person, on the last darte fixed for the recepitof 
application or on such other date as may be specified by the appointing authority. 
(2) Where maximum age limits other than age limits specifed in sub rule (1) are fixed for 
recuritment for any service or post than unless the rules of recuritment provided or 
enhanced age 
limit in the case of the person belonging to Scheduled Castes, Scheduled Tribes, 
Backward Tribes, 
or Backward Castes or Backward communities, the maximum age limit shall be deemed 
to have 
30 
the enhanced by five years in the case of a candidate belonging to any schduled Caste 
or Schduled 
Tribe or Backward Tribe and by three years in the case of a canditate belonging to any 
any Backward 
caste or Backward communite. 
(2A) Notwithstanding that the maximum age limit specified in the rules of recuritment 
to any service of or post is less than those prescribed in sub-rule (1), the maximum age 
limits 
specified in the said sub-rule (1) shall respectively be deemed to be maximum age limits 
in respect 
of the class or persons specified therein for recruitment to the said service or post.” 
4. Savings.- Recruitment to nay service or most in the said service pending on the date 
of 
commencement of these rules shall be finalised in accordance with the rules which were 
in force 
immediately prior to the commencement of these rules. 
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
B.B. BAJENTRI, 
Under Secretary to Government, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 5-4-1979 



31 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
NOTIFICATION 
NO. DPAR 1 SRR 79, Bangalore, dated 9th August 1979 
In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of 
India, 
the Governor of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules further to amend the 
Karnataka Civil 
Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 namely:- 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Fifth Amendment) Rules, 1979. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of rule 5.- In clause (e) of sub-rule (1) of rule 5 of the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 (hereinafter referred to as the said Rules), for the 
words “Zaire 
and Ethiopia” the words “Zaire, Ethiopia and Vietnam” shall be substited. 
3. Amendment of Rule 16.- To sub-clause (ii) of clause (a) of rule 16 of the said rules, 
the 
following proviso shall be added namely:- 
“Provided that appointment under this sub-clause shall not be made unless the officer 
has passed the examinations precribed under the Karnataka Civil Services (Service and 
Kannada Language Examinations) Rules, 1974 for the post to which he is proposed to 
be 
transferred or deputed”. 
4. Amendment of Rule 19.- In sub-rule (4) of rule 19 of the said rules, 
(i) after the words “confirmation” the words “or promotion” shall be inserted; 
(ii) after the words “officiation as the case may be” the words “which the person had to 
undergo” shall be and shall always be deemed to have been inserted. 
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
B.B. BAJENTRI, 
Under Secretary to Government, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 23-8-1979 
32 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
NOTIFICATION 
NO. DPAR 18 SRR 79, Bangalore, dated 13th March 1980. 
In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of 
India, 
the Governor of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules further to amend the 
Karnataka Civil 
Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 namely:- 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Sixth Amendment) Rules, 1980. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 



2. Amendment of rule 9.- In sub-rule (3) of Rule 9 of the Karnataka Civil Services 
(General 
Recruitment) Rules, 1977, the words, brackets and figure “sub-rule (1) and” shall be 
omitted. 
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA, 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
B.B. BAJENTRI, 
Under Secretary to Government, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
published in Gazette dated 27-3-1980 
 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
NOTIFICATION 
No. DPAR 23 SRR 99, Bangalore, Dated 23-11-2000. 
Whereas the draft of the following rules further to amend the Karnataka Civil Services 
(General 
Recruitment) Rules, 1977 was published as required by clause (a) of sub-section (2) of 
Section 3 
read with section 8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Karnataka Act 14 of 
1990) in 
Notification No. DPAR 23 SRR 99, dated 22-7-2000 in part IVA of the Karnataka Gazette 
Extraordinary 
dated 22-7-2000 inviting objections and suggestions from persons likely to be affected 
thereby within thirty days from the date of the publication of the draft in the Official 
Gazette. 
Whereas the said draft was made available to the public on 22-7-2000. 
And whereas the objections and suggestions received in this behalf have been 
considered 
by the State Government. 
Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of section 3 read 
with section 8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Karnataka Act 14 of 
1990) the 
Government of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules, namely:- 
RULES 
1. Title, Commencement and Application :- (1) These rules may be called the 
Karnataka 
Civil Services (General recruitment) (Seventh Amendment) Rules, 2000. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of Rule 9 :- In Rule 9 of the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) 
Rules, 1977. 
(i) in the heading, for the words "and physically handicapped," a comma and the words 
"physically handicapped and members of the family of a project displaced person" shall 
be 
substituted 
(ii) after sub-rule (1A), the following shall be inserted, namely:- 
“(1AA) Notwithstanding anything contained in the rules of recruitment specially made in 
respect of 
any service or post, if in such rules of recruitment direct recruitment is prescribed as one 



of 
the methods of recruitment, for a period of twenty years from the date of commencement 
of the Karnataka Civil Services (General Recruitment) (Fifth Seventh Amendment) 
Rules, 
2000, five percent of the posts set apart for that method in each of the categories of 
General 
Merit, Scheduled Castes and Scheduled Tribes and in each of the categories among 
other 
Backward Classes, shall be filled by direct recruitment from among the members of the 
family of a project displaced person: 
Provided that, this sub-rule shall not apply to direct recruitment to Group-A and Group-B 
posts. 
Provided further that where on account of acquisition of any land or plot in the 
gramatana or 
other property belonging to a project displaced person, possession thereof was taken 
twenty years 
34 
prior to the commencement of the Karnataka Civil Services (General Recruitment) (Fifty 
Seventh 
Amendment) Rules, 2000, the members of the family of such project displaced person 
shall not be 
eligible for recruitment under this sub-rule: 
Providing also that, all things being equal, direct recruitment under this sub-rule shall be 
made in the following order of preference, namely:- 
(i) the members of the family of a project displaced person who has lost to a project, his 
dwelling house and at least fifty percent of his agricultural land on which he was 
dependent; 
(ii) the members of the family of a project displaced person who was landless in the 
preproject 
period, but lost his dwelling house to a project; 
(iii) the members of the family of a project displaced person who has lost to a project 
only 
fifty percent or less of his agricultural land on which he was dependent; 
(iv) the members of the family of a project displaced person in any other case. 
Explanation.- For the purpose of this sub-rule,- "project displaced person" means any 
tenure holder, 
tenant, Government lessee or owner of other property who has been in possession of 
the land or 
other property for a period of at least five years before the date of publication of the 
preliminary 
notification of acquisition of such land or property and who on account of acquisition of 
his land, 
including plot in the gramatana or other property in the affected area under the project, 
has been 
displaced from such land or other property the purpose of the project; 
"Members of the family" in relation to a project displaced person means 
“(i) after the words, brackets and figures “sub-clause (iii)” the words, brackets and 
figures “and sub-clause (vi)” shall be inserted; and 
(ii) for the words “or the Deputy Minister concerned” the words “the Deputy Minister 
or the Member of Parliament concerned” shall be substituted. 
By Order and in the name of the 



Governor of Karnataka 
S. Chandrashekarappa 
Under Secretary to Government, 
DPAR (Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 10-4-1980 
35 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
NOTIFICATION 
NO. DPAR 2 SRR 77, Bangalore, dated 18th November 1980 
In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of 
India, 
the Governor of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules further to amend the 
Karnataka Civil 
Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 namely:- 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Eighth Amendment) Rules, 1980. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of rule 6.- In clause (b) of sub-rule (3) of rule 6 of the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) Rules, 1977, for the words “a corporation owned or controlled by 
the 
Government”, the words “a corporation established by a State Act or a General Act or 
established 
by the Government under a State Act or Central Act and owned or controlled by the 
Government,” 
shall be substituted. 
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
B.B. BAJENTRI, 
Under Secretary to Government, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 27-11-1980 
36 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
NOTIFICATION 
NO. DPAR 69 SRR 76, Bangalore, dated 2nd December 1980 
In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of 
India, 
the Governor of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules further to amend the 
Karnataka Civil 
Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 namely:- 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Ninth Amendment) Rules, 1980. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of rule 6.- In clause (c) of sub-rule (3) of rule 5 of the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 (hereinafter referred to as the said rules) for the 



words “by the 
number of years” the words “by three years plus the number of years” shall be 
substituted. 
3. Savings.- Notwithstanding the amendment to the said rules by rule 2, recruitment to 
any 
service or post advertised before the commencement of these rules shall be made as if 
the said 
rules have not been amended by these rules. 
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
B.B. BAJENTRI, 
Under Secretary to Government, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 11-12-1980 
37 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
NOTIFICATION 
NO. DPAR 44 SRR 80, Bangalore, dated 6th January 1981 
In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of 
India, 
the Governor of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules further to amend the 
Karnataka Civil 
Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 namely:- 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Tenth Amendment) Rules, 1981. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of rule 2.- In rule 2 of the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) 
Rules, 1977 (hereinafter referred to as the said rules), after clause (d) of sub-rule (1), the 
following 
clause shall be inserted, namely:- 
“(d) “bonded labourer” means a person who has been released from the bonded labour 
system by virtue of the Bonded Labour System (Abolition) Act, 1976 (Central Act 19 of 
1976) or the rules made thereunder or the Karnataka Bonded Labour System (Abolition) 
ordinance 1975, and who produces a certificate from the District Magistrate that he is 
a bonded labourer who has been released from liability to pay the bonded debt under 
the provisions of the said Act or the Karnataka Bonded Labour System (Abolition) 
Ordinance 1975 (Karnataka Ordinance 13th of 1975)”. 
3. Amendment of Rule 6:- In rule 6 of the said rules after clause (1) of sub-rule (3) the 
following clause shall be inserted, namely:- 
“(j) in the case of a candidate who is a bonded labourer by ten years.” 
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
B.B. BAJENTRI, 
Under Secretary to Government, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 



Published in Gazette dated 22-1-1981 
38 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
NOTIFICATION 
NO. DPAR 31 SRR 78, Bangalore, dated 4th February 1981 
In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of 
India, 
the Governor of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules further to amend the 
Karnataka Civil 
Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 namely:- 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Eleventh Amendment) Rules, 1981. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of rule 4.- In rule 4 of the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) 
Rules, 1977, in clause (1), the word “and” at the end shall be omitted and after the 
clause (1), as so 
amended the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:- 
“Provided that if two or more candidates have secured equal number of total marks in 
the competitive examination or in the process of selection, as the case may be, the 
order of merit in respect of such candidates shall be fixed on the basis of their age, the 
person or persons older in age being placed higher in the order of merit”. 
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
B.B. BAJENTRI, 
Under Secretary to Government, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 10-2-1981 
39 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 72 SRR 80, Bangalore, dated 25th April 1981 
In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of 
India, 
the Governor of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules further to amend the 
Karnataka Civil 
Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 namely:- 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Twelth Amendment) Rules, 1981. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of Rule 9.- In sub-rule (1A) of the rule 9 of the Karnataka Civil Services 
(General Recruitment) Rules, 1977, for the words “two percent” in the two places where 
they occur 
the words “four percent” shall be substituted. 
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA, 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 



B.B. BAJENTRI, 
Under Secretary to Government, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated -5-1981 
40 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 9 SRR 80, Bangalore, dated 8th June 1981 
In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of 
India, 
the Governor of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules further to amend the 
Karnataka Civil 
Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 namely:- 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Thirteenth Amendment) Rules, 1981. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of Rule 15.- In rule 15 of the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) 
Rules, 1977, (hereinafter referred to as the said rules), in sub-rule (1), in clause (b), in 
sub-clause 
(ii), the words” and carrying a minimum pay of not less than rupees one thousand and 
five hundred 
per month” shall be omitted. 
3. Amendment of rule 16.- In clause (a) of rule 16 of the said rules,- 
(1) after the proviso to sub-clause (ii), the following further provisos shall be inserted, 
namely:- 
“Provided further that, where it is necessary in public interest to appoint an officer 
belonging 
to a service where has no equivalent grade, an officer holding a post in the next lower 
grade in such 
service may be appointed by deputation for a period not exceeding two years. 
Provided also that no such appointment shall be to a post which is equivalent to or 
higher 
than the next promotional post to such officer in such other service.” 
(2) after sub-clause (iii), the following sub-clause and the proviso thereunder shall be 
inserted, 
namely:- 
“(iiia) an officer who by bodily infirmity is temporaily incapacitated for the post which he 
holds: 
Provided that the duration of appointment under this sub-clause shall not be for a period 
longer than the duration of the bodily infirmity on account of which he is held to be 
incapacitated to 
hold the post in the service to which he belongs”. 
4. Insertion of new rule 16A.- After rule 16 of the said rules the following rule shall be 
inserted, namely:- 
“16A. Appointment by transfer within the service:- Notwithstanding anything contained in 
these rules or the rules of recruitment specially made in respect of any service post, a 
Head of the 
Department in respect of a service may, in public interest and for reasons to be recorded 



in writing 
and subject to any general instructions that may be issued by Government in this behalf, 
appoint by 
transfer a member of a Class IV or Class III service of that service from a post in one 
unit of 
seniority to a post in identical scale of pay in another unit of seniority to a post in 
identical scale of 
41 
pay in another unit of seniority within the same service provided-the possesses the 
qualifications 
prescribed for the latter post”. 
Explanation:- Unit of Seniority’ means each of the jurisdictions of the authorities 
competent 
to make appointment to a post from which and to to the post to which the member of 
Class IV or 
Class III service who is proposed to be appointed under this rule belongs. 
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA, 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
A.H. SOMESHWAR, 
Deputy Secretary to Government, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 18-6-1981 
42 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 38 SRR 79, Bangalore, dated 21st July 1981 
In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of 
India, 
the Governor of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules further to amend the 
Karnataka Civil 
Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 namely:- 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Fourteenth Amendment) Rules, 1981. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of Rule 11.- For the proviso to rule 11 of the Karnataka Civil Services 
(General 
Recruitment) Rules, 1977 the following proviso shall be substituted, namely:- 
“Provided that, where a Government servant, who has executed an agreement in favour 
of Government agreeing to serve the Government for a specified period in consideration 
of his 
having been deputed for training, applies for a higher post or higher service in any 
Government 
Department or in any company or Corporation owned or controlled by the State 
Government or by 
the Central Government or in any Statutory or Local Authority within the State of 
Karnataka, or a 
University or Educational Institution established by Law within the State of Karnataka, 
and the training 



for which he was deputed is related to the duties attached to the post or service to which 
he has 
made the application, then notwithstanding anything in the agreement, the said authority 
shall grant 
the permission and forward the application subject to the condition that this Government 
Servant 
executes a fresh bond agreeing to serve the new employer for the balance period for 
which he was 
bound to serve the Government under the terms of the original agreement. 
Provided further that this rule shall not be applicable to a Government Servant employed 
in any department of the Government as a local candidate as long as he is treated as 
such”. 
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA, 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
V.S. NAIK, 
Under Secretary to Government, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 30-7-1981 
43 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 64 SRR 79, Bangalore, dated 27th August 1981 
In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of 
India, 
the Governor of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules further to amend the 
Karnataka Civil 
Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 namely:- 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Fifteenth Amendment) Rules, 1981. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of Rule 9.- In sub-rule (1A) of the rule 9 of the Karnataka Civil Services 
(General Recruitment) Rules, 1977, after the proviso the following further proviso shall 
be inserted, 
namely,- 
“Provided further that this sub-rule shall also not be applicable for direct recruitment of 
persons suffering from a physical handicap of such nature and in respect of such posts 
as may be 
specified by Notification, by Government from time to time. 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
V.S. NAIK 
Under Secretary to Government, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 10-9-1981 
44 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 



No. DPAR 25 SRR 80, Bangalore, dated 20th May 1982 
In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of 
India, 
the Governor of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules further to amend the 
Karnataka Civil 
Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 namely:- 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Sixteenth Amendment) Rules, 1982. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of Rule 5.- In the proviso under clause (e) of sub-rule (1) of rule 5 of the 
Karnataka Civil Services (General Recruitment) 1977, (hereinafter referred to as the said 
rules) 
between the words “eligibility” and “issued” the words “indicating the date of migration” 
shal be 
inserted. 
3. Amendment of rule 6:- After clause (6) of sub-rule (1) of rule 6 of the said rules, the 
following proviso shall be inserted namely:- 
Provided that in the case of the following repatriates the upper age limit shall be relaxed 
by 
three years for recruitment through competitive examinations held by the Karnataka 
Public Service 
Commission and upto fortyfive years for all other recruitments, and it shall be further 
relaxed by five 
years for persons belonging to the Scheduled Castes and Scheduled Tribes among 
them:- 
(a) Persons of Indian origin who migrated to India from East Pakistan (now Bangladesh) 
on 
or after 1st January 1964 but before 26th March 1971; 
(b) Persons of Indian origin from Burma who have migrated on or after the 1st June 
1963 
and the repatriates from Ceylon (now Sri Lanka) who have migrated on or after 1st 
November 1964; 
(c) Persons of Indian origin who have migrated from the East African Countries of 
Kenya, 
Uganda and the United Republic of Tanzania; 
(d) Persons of Indian origin who have migrated from Vietnam. 
4. Amendment of rule 13.- After the explanation in rule 13 of the said rules the following 
further proviso shall be inserted namely:- 
“Provided further that persons of Indian origin who has migrated from East Pakistan 
(now 
Bangladesh), Burma and Lanks shall be exempt from the Payment of the fee prescribed 
in respect 
of the application for the post advertised or for admission to competitive examination 
conducted by 
the Karnataka Public Service Commission. 
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA, 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
V.S. NAIK, 
Under Secretary to Government, 



Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 1-7-1982 
45 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 78 SRR 76, Bangalore, dated 19th June 1982 
In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of 
India, 
the Governor of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules further to amend the 
Karnataka Civil 
Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 namely:- 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Seventeenth Amendment) Rules, 1982. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of Rule 3.- Rule 3 of the Karnataka Civil Services (General Recruitment) 
Rules, 1977 shall be renumbered as sub-rule (1) thereof, and, after the sub-rule (1) as 
so 
renumbered, the following sub-rule shall be inserted, namely:- 
“(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in these rules or in the rules of recruitment 
specially 
made in respect of any service or post,- 
(a) the promotion to the post of a Head of Department or the post of the Addition Head 
of Department, if it is in a grade equivalent to that of the Head of the department 
concerned, shall be 
by selection; and 
(b) the promotion to all other posts shall be on the basis of seniority-cum-merit”. 
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA, 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
V.S. NAIK, 
Under Secretary to Government, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 24-6-1982 
46 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 5 SRR 82, Bangalore, dated 27th September 1982 
In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of 
India, 
the Governor of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules further to amend the 
Karnataka Civil 
Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 namely:- 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Eighteenth Amendment) Rules, 1982. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of Rule 2.- In rule 2 of the Karnataka Civil Service (General 
Recuritment) 



Rules, 1977, in sub-rule (1)- 
(1) in clause (b), after the words, “Indian States” the words “but excludes the Assam 
Rifles, 
Defence Security Corporations, General Reserve Engineering Force, Lok Sahayak Sena 
and 
Territorial Army” shall be inserted; and 
(2) for clause (i) the following clause shall be submitted namely:- 
“(i) “Ex-serviceman” means a person, who has served in any rank (whether as a 
combatant or as non-combatant) in the Armed Forces of the Union for a continuous 
period of not 
less than six months after attestation, and- 
(a) has been released, otherwise than at his own request or by way of dismissal or 
discharge on account of misconduct or inefficiency, or has been transferred to the 
reserve pending 
such release, or 
(b) has to serve for not more than six months for completing the period of service 
requisite 
for becoming entitled to be released or transferred to the reserve as aforesaid, or 
(c) has been released at his own request, after completing five years service in the 
Armed 
Forces of the Union.” 
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA, 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
V.S. NAIK, 
Under Secretary to Government, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 21-10-1982 
47 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 36 SRR 80, Bangalore, dated 20th October 1982 
In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of 
India, 
the Governor of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules further to amend the 
Karnataka Civil 
Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 namely:- 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Nineteenth Amendment) Rules, 1982. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Insertion of new Rule 3A.- After rule of Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) 
Rules, 1977 the following rule shall be inserted, namely:- 
“3A. Qualification in respect of Ex-servicemen.- 
Notwithstanding anything contained in rule 3 of these rules or the rules of recruitment 
specially made in respect of any service or post,- 
(1) for appointment to any vacancy reserved for ex-servicemen in cadres of posts falling 
under Group-D, every ex-serviceman who has put in not less than three years’ service in 
the Armed 



Forces of the Union shall be exempt from the minimum education qualification if any, 
prescribed in 
respect of such cadre or posts, and 
(2) for appointment to any vacancy reseerved for ex-servicemen in cadres or posts 
other than clerical posts, following under Group-C,- 
(a) the minimum educational qualification, where such qualification prescribed is a pass 
in 
VII standard or any lower examination, may be relaxed in favour of ex-servicemen who 
have put in 
at least three years’ service in the Armed Forces of the Union and who are otherwise 
considered fit 
and suitable for appointment to such cadre or posts; 
(b) where the posts are to be filled partly by direct recruitment and partly by promotion or 
transfer, and the minimum educational or technical qualification prescribed for 
appointment by 
direct requirement is higher than that prescribed for promotion or transfer, an ex-
serviceman shall 
be deemed to satisfy the prescribed educational or technical qualification if he,- 
(i) satisfies the education or technical qualifications prescribed for promotion to the post 
and 
(ii) has identical experience of work in a similar dispute the and for the same number of 
years 
in the Armed Forces of the Union, as prescribed for the promotees. 
48 
Explanation:- 
For the purposes of this rule, in computing the period of three years’ service, there shall 
be added any period of service which an ex-serviceman has rendered while serving in a 
corresponding post or posts in a civil department, or a public sector undertaking or an 
autonomous 
organisation, whether under the Central Government or and State Government or in a 
Nationalised 
Bank to the period of service rendered in the Armed Forces of the Union”. 
Governor of Karnataka, 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka 
V.S. NAIK, 
Under Secretary to Government, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 11-11-1982 
49 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 58 SRR 80, Bangalore, dated 5th November 1982 
In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of 
India, 
the Governor of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules further to amend the 
Karnataka Civil 
Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 namely:- 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 



(General Recruitment) (Twentieth Amendment) Rules, 1982. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of Rule 6.- In rule 7 of the Karnataka Civil Service (General 
Recuritment) 
Rules, 1977, after the existing proviso the following further proviso shall be and shall be 
deemed 
always to have been added, namely:- 
“Provided further that nothing in this rule shall apply to a Government Servant who is 
retained in service upto the last day of the month in accordance with the proviso to 
clause (a) of 
Rule 95 of the Karnataka Civil Services Rules.” 
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA, 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
V.S. NAIK, 
Under Secretary to Government, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 2-12-1982 
50 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 31 SRR 82, Bangalore, dated 25th February 1983 
In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of 
India, 
the Governor of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules further to amend the 
Karnataka Civil 
Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 namely:- 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Twenty-First Amendment) Rules, 1983. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of Rule 18.- In sub-rule (1) of rule 18 of the Karnataka Civil Services 
(General 
Recruitment) Rules 1977, for the words “forty-five days” the words “fifteen days” shall be 
substituted. 
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA, 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
V.S. NAIK, 
Under Secretary to Government, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 10-3-1983 
51 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 33 SRR 83, Bangalore, dated 10th April 1984 
In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of 
India, 
the Governor of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules further to amend the 



Karnataka Civil 
Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 namely:- 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Twenty Second Amendment) Rules, 1984. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of Rule 3.- In clause (a) of sub-rule (2) of rule 3 of the Karnataka Civil 
Services (General Recrutiment) Rules, 1977, the following proviso shall be inserted, 
namely:- 
“Provided that for the purpose of promotion by selection, the number of persons to be 
considered shall be such number of persons eligible for promotion in the order of 
seniority, as is 
equal to five times the number of vacancies to be filled.” 
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA, 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
G.K. SANGORAM, 
Under Secretary to Government, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 10-5-1984 
52 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 5 SRR 83, Bangalore, dated 10th May 1984 
In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of 
India, 
the Governor of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules further to amend the 
Karnataka Civil 
Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 namely:- 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Twenty Third Amendment) Rules, 1984. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of Rule 12.- In rule 22 of the Karnataka Civil Service (General 
Recuritment) 
Rules, 1977, after sub-rule (1), the following sub-rule shall be inserted, namely:- 
“(1a) A candidate selected for appointment who fails to appear before the medical 
authority 
specified by the Government under sub-rule (1) shall be given one more opportunity to 
appear 
before such authority. If the candidate fails to appear before the medical authority even 
on the 
second occasion, his name shall stand deleted from the list of selected candidates and 
he shall 
cease to be eligible for appointment.” 
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA, 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
G.K. SANGORAM, 
Under Secretary to Government, 



Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 14-6-1984 
53 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
NOTIFICATION 
NO. DPAR 17 SRR 84, Bangalore, dated 28th May, 1985 
In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of 
India, 
the Governor of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules further to amend the 
Karnataka Civil 
Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 namely:- 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Twentyfourth Amendment) Rules, 1985 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of Rule 15.- In rule 15 of the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) 
Rules, 1977, after sub-clause (iii) of clause (b) of sub-rule (1), the following sub-clause 
shallb e and 
shall be deemed to have been inserted with effect from the tenth day of January 1983 
namely,- 
(iv) Posts in the personal establishment of a Chair-person of a Commision or a 
Committee 
constituted by the Government, where such Chair-person is a non-official and has 
been given the status of a Cabinet Minister or a Minister of State of a Deputy Minister". 
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
G.K. NAIK, 
Under Secretary to Government, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 20th June 1985 
54 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
NOTIFICATION 
NO. DPAR 21 SRR 85, Bangalore, dated 31st July, 1985 
In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of 
India, 
I, A.N. Banerji, Governor of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules further to 
amend the 
Karnataka Civil Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 namely:- 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Twentyfifth Amendment) Rules, 1985 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of rule 11.- For the provisos to rule 11 of the Karnataka Civil Services 
(General 
Recruitment) Rules, 1977, the following proviso shall be substituted, namely:- 
“Provided that this rule shall not be applicable to a Government Servant employed in 



any department of the Government as a Local Candidate as long as he is treated as 
such”. 
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
G.K. SANGORAM 
Under Secretary to Government, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 5-9-1985 
55 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 19 SRR 84, Bangalore, dated 4th April 1986 
In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of 
India, 
I, A.N. Banerji, Governor of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules further to 
amend the 
Karnataka Civil Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 namely:- 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Twenty Sixth Amendment) Rules, 1986. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of Rule 13.- In the first proviso to rule 13 of the Karnataka Civil Services 
(General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 for the words “in the case of a candidate belonging 
to a Scheduled 
Caste or a Scheduled Tribe or a Backward Tribe and” the words “a candidate belonging 
to a 
Scheduled Caste or a Scheduled Tribe or a Backward Tribe shall be exempt from the 
payment of 
any fees prescribed under this rule and in the case of” shall be substituted. 
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
G.K. SANGORAM, 
Under Secretary to Government, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 17-4-1986 
56 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 39 SLC 85(1), Bangalore, dated 5th September 1986 
In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of 
India, 
the Governor of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules further to amend the 
Karnataka Civil 
Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 namely:- 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Twenty Seventh Amendment) Rules, 1986. 



(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of Rule 6.- In clause (b) of sub-rule (3) of rules of the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) Rules, 1977, (hereinafter referred to as the said rules), for the 
words "five 
years" the words "ten years" shall be substituted. 
3. Savings.- Notwithstanding the amendment to the said rules, by rule 2, recruitment to 
any 
service or post advertised before the commencement of these rules shall be made as if 
the said 
rules have not been amended by these rules if the last date specified in the 
advertisement or any 
extended time limit fr receipt of application is already over. 
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA, 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
G.K. SANGORAM, 
Under Secretary to Government, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 5-9-1986 
57 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 21 SRR 86, Bangalore, dated 12th December 1986 
In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of 
India, 
I.A.N. Banerji, Governor of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules further to amend 
the 
Karnataka Civil Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 namely:- 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Twenty Eighth Amendment) Rules, 1986. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of Rule 2.- In rule 2 of the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) 
Rules, 1977, (hereinafter referred to as the said rules), in sub-rule (1) for clause (d), the 
following 
clause shall be substituted namely:- 
"(d) "Backward Group" "Backward Group B" "Backward Group C" Backward Group D" 
and "Backward Group E" respectively mean the backward classes specified under 
"Group A" "Group 
B" "Group C" "Group D" and "Group E" in Annexure-II to the Government Order No. 
SWL 66 BCA 
86, dated the 13th October 1986 as amended in Government Order No. SWL 66 BCA 
86, dated the 
19th November, 1986. 
3. Amendment of rule 6.- In rule 6 of the said rules, in sub-rule (1)- 
(i) in clause (a) for the words "Backward Tribes" the words "Backward Group A" shall be 
substituted. 
(ii) in clause (b), for the words "backward castes or backward communities", the wrods 



"Backward Group B", Backward Group C" and "Backward Group D" shall be substituted; 
(iii) in sub-rule (2)- 
(a) for the words "Backward Tribes, Backward Castes or Backward Communities" the 
words "Backward Group A, Backward Group B, Backward Group C and Backward 
Group D" shall be substituted. 
(b) for the words "Backward Tribe" the wrods "Backward Group A" shall be substituted; 
(c) for the words "Backward Caste and Backward Communities" the words "Backward 
Group B, Backward Group C and Backward Group D" shal be substituted. 
58 
4. Amendment of rule 8.- In rule 8 of the said rules the words "Backward Tribes" shall 
be 
deleted. 
5. Amendment of rule 9.- In sub-rule (3) of rule 9 of the said rules, the words 
"Backward 
Tribes" shall be deleted. 
6. Amendment of rule 13.- In rule 13 of the said rules, in the first proviso, for the words 
"Backward Tribe" the words "the Backward Group A" shall be substituted. 
7. Amendment of other Rules:- 
(1) In the Karnataka Recruitment of Gazetted Probationers (Appointment by Competitive 
Examinations) Rules, 1966, the Karnataka State Civil Services (Direct Recruitment by 
Selection) 
Rules, 1973, the Karnataka Civil Services (Recruitment to the Ministerial Posts) Rules, 
1978 and 
any other rules issued under proviso to article 309 of the Constitution of India, 
i) for the words "Backward Tribe" the words "Backward Group A" shall be substituted; 
ii) for the words "Backward Castes or Backward Communities", the words "Backward 
Group B, Backward Group C or Backward Group D" shall be substituted. 
iii) any reference to G.O. No. DPAR 1 SBC 77 dated 4th March 1977 shall be construed 
as 
a referenced to G.O. No. DPAR 28 SBC 86, dated 12th December 1986. 
2) In the Orders, Schedules, Notifications, Regulations or instructions, in force, 
immediately 
prior to the commencement of these rules:- 
i) any reference made to the "Backward Tribes" shall be construed to be reference to the 
"Backward Group A" 
ii) any reference to "Backward Castes" or "Backward Communities" shall be construed to 
be reference the "Backward Group B" or "Backward Group C" or "Backward Group D". 
iii) any reference to the "Backward Special Group" shall be construed to be reference to 
the 
"Backward Group E". 
Savings.- Notwithstanding anything in these rules or the Government Order No. SWL 66 
BCA 86, daed 13th October, 1986 all recruitments pending on the said date shall be 
proceeded with 
and finalised: 
(a) Where the competitive examinations interview or viva-voice (hereinafter referred to 
as the 
modes of recruitment) or any of them has commenced or is completed, but the list of 
selected 
candidates has not been published, after requiring the candidates to file fresh 
declarations in the 
form annexed to G.O.No. DPAR 28 SBC 86, dated 12th December 1986 and 



reclassifying them in 
accordance there with but without inviting fresh applications; 
(b) Where none of the said modes of recruitment has commenced in accordance with 
the 
Government Order No. DPAR 28 SBC 86, dated 12th December 1986 and the said rules 
as amended 
by these rules, after calling for fresh applications. 
59 
Provided that if a candidate has applied for recruitment prior to the commencement of 
these rules and he is within the prescribed age limits under the rules in force before such 
commencement, his application shall be deemed to be one made for the purpose of 
clause (b) and 
he shall not be required to file fresh applications but shall only be required to file fresh 
declaration in 
the form annexed to the said Government Order. 
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA, 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
G.K. SANGORAM, 
Under Secretary to Government, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 21-12-1986 
60 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 11 SRR 86, Bangalore, dated 4th May 1987 
In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of 
India, 
I.A.N. Banerji, Governor of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules further to amend 
the 
Karnataka Civil Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 namely:- 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Twenty Ninth Amendment) Rules, 1987. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of Rule 3A.- In rule 3A of the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) 
Rules, 1977,- 
(a) in sub-rule (2), after clause (b), the following shall be inserted, namely:- 
"(c) a matriculate Ex-serviceman who has put in a service of not less than fifteen years in 
the 
Armed Forces of the Unionmay be considered if the minimum educational qualification 
prescribed for such vacancy or post is a Graduation and where,- 
i) work experience of technical or professional nature is not essential pr 
ii) though non-technical professional work experience is prescribed, the appointing 
authority 
is satisfied that the Ex-serviceman is expected to undergo a job training for a short 
duration to perform the duties of the said post. 
Explanation:- For the purpoe of this clause, the term "matriculate Ex-servicemen" 
includes 



an ex-serviceman who has obtained the Indian Army Special Certificate of Education of 
the equivalent 
certificate in the Navy or Air Force". 
(b) after sub-rule (2), the following shall be inserted, namely:- 
"(3) for appointment to any vacancy reserved for Ex-servicemen in a Cadre or post other 
than 
a clerical post falling under Group-C or Group-D, where the prescribed minimum 
educational 
qualification is a pass in Matriculation, the appointing authority may, at his discrition, 
relax such 
qualification in favour of ex-servicemen who have passed the Indian Army Class-I 
Examination or 
equivalent examination in the Navy or the Air Force and who have put in at least 15 
years of serive 
in the Armed Forces of the Union and are otherwise considered fit and suitable for 
appointment to 
such cadre or post on account of their experience and other qualifications. 
(4) for appointment to direct recruitment vacancy reserved for Ex-servicemen, if 
sufficient 
number of candidates belonging to the category of ex-servicemen are not available on 
the basis of 
61 
general standard to fill all such vacancies reserved for them, candidates belonging to 
such category 
may be selected under relaxed standard of selection to make up the deficiency in the 
reserved 
quota subject to the condition that such relaxation will not affect the level of performance 
by such 
candidates". 
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA, 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
G.K. SANGORAM, 
Under Secretary to Government, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 18-6-1987 
62 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 31 SRR 83, Bangalore, dated 20th May 1988 
In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of 
India, 
the Governor of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules further to amend the 
Karnataka Civil 
Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 namely:- 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Thirtieth Amendment) Rules, 1988. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of Rule 17.- In clause (c) of rule 17 of the Karnataka Civil Services 



(General 
Recruitment) Rules, 1977 for the words "one year" the words "two years" shall be 
substituted. 
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA, 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
P. RAMANATH 
Under Secretary to Government, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 16-6-1988 
63 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 16 SRR 83 (I), Bangalore, dated 15th March 1989 
In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of 
India, 
I.P. Venkatasubbaiah, Governor of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules further 
to amend 
the Karnataka Civil Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 namely:- 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Thirty First Amendment) Rules, 1989. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of Rule 19.- In the second proviso to sub-rule (1) of rule 19 of the 
Karnataka 
Civil Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977, for the words 'similar or equivalent' 
wherever 
they occur, the words 'similar and equivalent' shall be substituted. 
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA, 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
M.C. GANGADHAR GUPTA 
Under Secretary to Government, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 20-4-1989 
64 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
NOTIFICATION 
NO. DPAR 19 SRR 88, Bangalore, dated 16th March 1989 
In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of 
India, 
I.P. Venkatasubbaiah, Governor of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules further 
to amend 
the Karnataka Civil Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 namely:- 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Thirty Second Amendment) Rules, 1989. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of rule 2.- In sub-rule (1) of rule 2 of the Karnataka Civil Services 



(General 
Recruitment) Rules, 1977 (hereinafter referred to as the said rules),- 
(1) for clause (b), the following shall be substituted, namely:- 
"(b) "Armed Forces of the Union" means the Naval, Army and Air Forces of the Union"; 
(2) for clause (i), the following shall be substituted, namely:- 
"(i) 'Ex-servicemen' means a person, who has served in any rank (whether as a 
combatant 
or as a non-combatant) in the Regular Army, Navy and Air Forces of the Union but does 
not include a person who has served in the Defence Security Corps, the General 
Reserve 
Engineering Force, the Lok Sahayak Sena and the para Military Forces, and 
(a) who has retired from such service after earning his pension; or 
(b) who has been released from such service on medical grounds attributable to military 
service or circumstances beyond his control and awarded medical or other disability 
pension; or 
(c) who has been released otherwise than on his own request from such service as a 
result of reduction in establishment; or 
(d) who has been released from such service after completing the specific period of 
engagement otherwise than at his own request or by way of dismissal or discharge on 
account of misconduct or in-efficiency and has been given a gratuity; 
and includes personnel of the Territorial Army of the following categories, namely:- 
i) Pension holders for continuous emboided service; 
ii) persons with disability attributable to military service; and 
iii) gallantry award winners. 
Explanation.- The persons serving in the Armed Forces of the Union, who on retirement 
from 
service, would come under the category of 'ex-servicemen' may be permitted to apply for 
re- 
65 
employment one year before the completion of the specified terms of engagement and 
avail 
themselves of all concessions available to ex-servicemen, but shall not be appointed to 
a State 
Civil Service or post until they are permitted to leave the uniform. 
3. Savings.- Notwithstanding the amendment to the said rules by rule 2, recruitment to 
any 
service or post advertised before the commencement of these rules shall be made as if 
the said 
rules have not been amended by these rules". 
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
M.C. GANGADHAR GUPTA 
Under Secretary to Government, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 27-4-1989 
66 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 26 SRR 88, Bangalore, dated 6th June 1989 



In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of 
India, 
I.P. Venkatasubbaiah, Governor of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules further 
to amend 
the Karnataka Civil Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 namely:- 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Thirty Third Amendment) Rules, 1989. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of Rule 15.- In rule 15 of the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) 
Rules, 1977,- 
(a) in sub-rule (1), in clause (b),- 
(i) the words and the comma "for a period not exceeding one year at a time" shall be 
omitted; 
(ii) after sub-clause (iv), the following sub-clause shall be inserted namely:- 
"(v) Group 'C' posts in the legal cell of the Karnataka Bhavan, New Delhi, when suitable 
persons are not available for appointment, according to the rules of recruitment 
applicable to the posts". 
(b) in sub-rule (2),- 
i) for the words "five years" the words "three years" shall be substituted; 
ii) the proviso shall be omitted. 
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA, 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
P. RAMANATH 
Under Secretary to Government, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 6-7-1989 
67 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 34 SRR 89, Bangalore, dated 22nd October, 1990 
In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of 
India, 
the Governor of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules further to amend the 
Karnataka Civil 
Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 namely:- 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Thirty-Fourth Amendment) Rules, 1990. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of Rule 15.- In rule 15 of the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) 
Rules, 1977, in sub-rule (2), 
(i) for the words "three years", the words "five years" shall be substituted; 
(ii) after sub-rule (2), the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:- 
"Provided that appointments to posts mentioned in sub-clause (iii) of clause (b) of 
sub-rule (1) may be made for a period co-terminus with the tenure of office of the 
Minister, the Minister of State or the Deputy Minister concerned". 



GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA, 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
P. RAMANATH 
Under Secretary to Government-I, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 1-11-1990 
68 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 1 SRR 90, Bangalore, dated 6th March 1991 
In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of 
India, 
the Governor of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules further to amend the 
Karnataka Civil 
Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 namely:- 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Thirty Fifth Amendment) Rules, 1991. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of Rule 1.- In rule (1) of the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) 
Rules, 1977, in sub-rule (3), after clause (a), the following shall be inserted namely:- 
"Provided that the provisions of rule 3(2), 3A, 9(1) and (1A), 15(1), 16, 16A and 17 of 
these rules shall have effect notwithstanding anything inconsistent therewith contained 
in the rules of recruitment specially made in respect of any service or post" 
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA, 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
P. RAMANATH 
Under Secretary to Government, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 21-2-1991 
69 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 21 SRR 91, Bangalore, dated 30th October 1991 
In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of 
India, 
the Governor of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules further to amend the 
Karnataka Civil 
Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 namely:- 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Thirty Sixth Amendment) Rules, 1991. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of Rule 6.- In rule 6 of the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) 
Rules 1977, hereinafter referred to as the said rules in sub-rule (1),- 



(i) in clause (a), for the words "thirty-five years", the words "thirty-eight years", shall be 
substituted. 
(ii) in clause (b), for the words "thirty-three years", the words "thirty-six years" shall be 
substituted; 
(iii) in clause (c), for the words "thirty years", the words "thirty-three years" shall be 
substituted. 
3. Savings.- Notwithstanding the amendment to said ruls by rule 2 of the Karnataka Civil 
Services (General Recruitment) (Thirty Sixth Amendment) Rules, 1991 (hereinafter 
referred to as 
these rules), recruitment to any service or post in the said service pending on the date of 
commencement of these rules shall be finalised in accordance with the rules which were 
in force 
immediately prior to the commencement of these rules. 
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA, 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
P. RAMANATH 
Under Secretary to Government, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 31-10-1991 
70 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 27 SRR 91, Bangalore, dated 29th November 1991 
In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of 
India, 
I, Khurshed Alam Khan, Governor of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules further 
to amend 
the Karnataka Civil Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 namely:- 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Thirty Seventh Amendment) Rules, 1991. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of Rule 17.- In clause (c) of rule 17 of the Karnataka Civil Services 
(General 
Recruitment) Rules, 1977 for the words 'two years', the words 'three years' shall be 
substituted. 
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA, 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
P. RAMANATH 
Under Secretary to Government, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 19-12-1991 
71 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
NOTIFICATION 
NO. DPAR 5 SRR 92, Bangalore, dated 31st March 1992 
In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of 



India, 
the Governor of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules further to amend the 
Karnataka Civil 
Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 namely:- 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Thirty Eighth Amendment) Rules, 1992. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of rule 1.- In the Karnataka Civil Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 
1977 (hereinafter referred to as the said rules, in rule 1, in sub-rule (3), in clause (a), in 
the proviso, 
for the figure "9(1)", the figures "3B, 9 (1)" shall be substituted; 
3. Amendment to rule 2.- In rule 2 of the said rules, after clause (n), the following shall 
be 
inserted, namely:- 
"(o) "Rural candidate" means a person who has studied and passed the Secondary 
School Leaving Certificate examination in any of the schools situated in rural areas 
having a population 
of less than twenty thousand as per the 1981 census"; 
4. Insertion of rule 3B:- After rule 3A of the said rules, the following shall be inserted, 
namely:- 
"3B. Weightage of marks to rural candidates:- 
Notwithstanding anything contained in these rules or in the Karnataka Civil Services 
(Direct Recruitment by Selection) Rules, 1973 or in any rules made under the proviso to 
Article 309 of the Constitution of India or any other rules of recruitment specially made in 
respect of any service or post, for all direct recruitment to Group-C and Group-D posts 
in the State Civil Services, a weightage of fifteen marks shall be added to the total marks 
secured by a rural candidate. The candidates from who have studied and passed the 
Secondary School Leaving Certificate examination in the schools situated in the areas 
having more than twenty thousand populatin as per 1981 Census, shall not be entitled to 
such weightage". 
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
M. LOKRAJ 
Under Secretary to Government-I, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 31-3-1992 
72 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 13 SRR 92, Bangalore, dated 1st April 1992 
In exercise of the powers conferred by the proviso to Article 309 of the Constitution of 
India, 
the Governor of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules further to amend the 
Karnataka Civil 
Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 namely:- 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Thirty Ninth Amendment) Rules, 1992. 



(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of Rule 8.- To rule 8 of the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitmen) 
Rules, 1977, the following proviso shall be inserted, namely,- 
"Provided that, notwithstanding anything in the rules of Recruitment specially made in 
respect of any Service or Post, the backlog vacancies in the promotional quota shall be 
determined and implemented with effect from 27th April, 1978. 
Note.- The backlog vacancy means the extent of the number of vacancies available 
under the roster system upto the level of lowest category in Group-A post calculated 
from 27th April, 1978". 
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA, 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
M. LOKRAJ, 
Under Secretary to Government-I, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 1-4-1992 
73 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
NOTIFICATION 
NO. DPAR 24 SRR 92, Bangalore, dated 22nd March 1993 
Whereas the draft of the rules further to amend the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) Rules, 1977 was published as required by sub-section 2(a) of Section 3 of 
the Karnataka 
State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Act No. 14 of 1990) in Notification No. DPAR 24 SRR 92, 
dated 25th 
August, 1992 in Part-IV section 2c(i) of the Karnataka Gazette dated 3rd September, 
1992 inviting 
objections and suggestions from persons likely to be affected thereby within thirty days 
from the 
date of the publication of the draft in the Official Gazette. 
Whereas the said Gazette was made available to the public on 3rd September, 1992. 
And whereas no objections and suggestions have been received by the State 
Government. 
Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of Section 3 read 
with Section 8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Karnataka Act No. 14 of 
1990) the 
Government of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules, namely:- 
RULES 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Fortieth Amendment) Rules, 1992. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of rule 9.- In rule 9 of the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) 
Rules, 1977:- 
(i) after the second proviso to sub-rule (1A), the following proviso shal be inserted, 
namely:- 
"Provided also that the vacancies set apart for the physically handicapped candidates 
under this sub-rule with effect from 22nd February, 1979 upto the date of 



commencement of 
Karnataka Civil Services, (General Recruitment) (Fortieth Amendment) Rules, 1992, 
whether filled 
by direct recruitment in accordane with sub-rule (2) or not, shall be deemed to be 
backlog vacancies 
and shall be filled by direct recruitment from among candidates who are physically 
handicapped." 
(ii) in sub-rule (2), the words, brackets, letter and figure "and sub-rule (1A)" shall be 
omitted. 
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
M. LOKRAJ 
Under Secretary to Government-I, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
74 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 23 SRR 93, Bangalore, dated 16th October 1993 
Whereas the draft of the rules further to amend the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) Rules, 1977 was published as required by sub-section 2(a) of Section 3 of 
the Karnataka 
State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Act No. 14 of 1990) in Notification No. DPAR 23 SRR 93, 
dated 13th 
July 1993 in Part-IV section 2c(i) of the Karnataka Gazette dated 5th August 1993 
inviting objections 
and suggestions from persons likely to be affected thereby within thirty days from the 
date of the 
publication of the draft in the Official Gazette. 
Whereas the said Gazette was made available to the public on 5th August 1993. 
And whereas no objections and suggestions have been received by the State 
Government. 
Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of Section 3 read 
with Section-8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Karnataka Act No. 14 of 
1990) the 
Government of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules, namely:- 
RULES 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Forty First Amendment) Rules, 1993. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of rule 3.- In the proviso to clause (a) of sub-rule (2) of rule 3 of the 
Karnataka 
Civil Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977, for the words "five times the number 
of vacancies 
to be filled", the figures and words "2(x) + 4 where (x) is the number of vacancies to be 
filled" shall 
be substituted. 
After the said proviso the following further proviso shall be inserted: 
"Provided furthe that the officer falling within the zone of consideration for promotion by 



selection shall not be considered for promotion unless he has atleast 3 months service 
from the 
date of occurence of the vacancy prior to his retirement on superannuation. 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
P. RAMANATH, 
Under Secretary to Government-I, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 11-11-1993 
75 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 42 SRR 93, Bangalore, dated 9th February 1994 
Whereas the draft of the rules further to amend the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) Rules, 1977 was published as required by sub-section 2(a) of (Act No. 14 
of 1990) in 
Notification No. DPAR 42 SRR 93, Section 3 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 
1978 dated 
5th November, 1993 Part-IV section 2c(i) of the Karnataka Gazette dated 2nd 
December, 1993 
inviting objections and suggestions from persons likely to be affected thereby within 
thirty days 
from the date of the publication of the draft in the Official Gazette. 
Whereas the said Gazette was made available to the public on 2nd December, 1993. 
And whereas no objections and suggestions have been received by the State 
Government. 
Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of Section 3 read 
with Section-8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Karnataka Act No. 14 of 
1990) the 
Government of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules, namely:- 
RULES 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Forty Second Amendment) Rules, 1994. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of rule 17.- In Rule 17 of the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) 
Rules, 1977. 
(i) in clause (b), for the punctuation makr semicolan and the word; "or" the punctuation 
mark 
full stop shall be substituted; 
(ii) after Clause (b), the following note shall be inserted, namely,- 
"Note:- Sae as provided in Clause (b), no promotion shall be made against a direct 
recruitment vacancy;" 
(iii) Clause (c) shall be omitted. 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
P. RAMANATH, 
Under Secretary to Government-I, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 



(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 24-2-1994 
76 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 5 SRR 92, Bangalore, dated 15th June 1994 
Whereas the draft of the rules further to amend the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) Rules, 1977 was published as required by sub-section 2(a) of Section 3 of 
the Karnataka 
State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Act No. 14 of 1990) in Notification No. DPAR 5 SRR 92, 
dated 22nd 
March, 1994 in Part-IV section 2c(i) of the Karnataka Gazette dated 28th April 1994 
inviting objections 
and suggestions from persons likely to be affected thereby within thirty days from the 
date of the 
publication of the draft in the Official Gazette. 
Whereas the said Gazette was made available to the public on 28th April 1994. 
And whereas no objections and suggestions received has been considered by the State 
Government. 
Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of Section 3 read 
with Section-8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Karnataka Act No. 14 of 
1990) the 
Government of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules, namely:- 
RULES 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Forty Third Amendment) Rules, 1994. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of rule 1.- In the proviso to clause (a) of sub-rule (3) of rule 1 of the 
Karnataka 
Civil Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 (hereinafter referred to as the said 
ruels) after 
the figure and letter "3A" the figure and letter "3B", shall be inserted. 
3. Amendment of rule 2.- In sub-rule (1) of rule 2 of the said rules, clause (mm) shall be 
renumbered as (mmm), and before the clause as so renumbered, the following shall be 
inserted, 
namely:- 
"(mm) 'Rural Candidate' means a person who has studied,- 
(i) from first standard to tenth standard and passed SSLC, where the qualifying 
examination 
prescribed for a post in SSLC or higher; or 
(ii) from first standard to the qualifying examination, where the qualifying examination 
prescribed for a post is lower than SSLC: 
in a school situated in an area / town other than the areas / towns specified in the 
Schedule. 
4. Insertion of rule 3B:- After the rule 3A of the said rules, the following shall be 
inserted, 
namely:- 
77 
"3B. Weightage of marks to rural candidates:- (1) Notwithstanding anything contained 
in these rules or in the Karnataka Civil Services (Direct Recruitment by Selection) Rules, 



1973 or in 
any other rules made or deemed to have been made under the Karnataka Civil Services 
Act, 1978 
(Karnataka Act No.14 of 1990) in all direct recruitments to Group-C and Group-D posts 
in the State 
Civil Services, in respect of a rural candidate, a weightage of,- 
(i) Five percent marks shall be added to the,- 
(a) marks secured in the qualifying examinations where the selection is based upon the 
marks secured in the qualifying examination; 
(b) marks secured in the qualifying examinations where the selection is based upon the 
marks secured in the qualifying examination and interview; 
(c) marks secured in the competitive examination or in the competitive examinations and 
interview/viva voce, as the case may be, where the selection is based upon the marks 
secured in the competitive examination or in the competitive examination and interview 
/ viva-voce. 
(ii) Five percent of the marks secured in the interview shall be added to the marks 
secured 
in the interview where the selection is made on the basis of the marks secured in the 
interview. 
Provided that no weightage shall be allowed to a rural candidate for whom a rural 
weightage 
has already been allowed in accordance with the rules of recruitment specially made in 
respect of 
any service or post". 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
P. RAMANATH, 
Under Secretary to Government-I, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Schedule 
Areas/Towns having population of 50,000 and above as per 1991 Census and / or which 
is a District Head Quarters: 
Sl.No. Name of the Place Population 
1. Bangalore Urban Agglomeration 
Bangalore 40,86,458 
Bangalore (MC) 
B.S.K. III Stage (OG) 
W.C.R. Layout (OG) 
Nagarabavi Layout (OG) 
J.P. Nagar (OG0 
H.A.L. III Stage (OG) 
B.T.M. Scheme (OG) 
HBR III Stage (OG) 
78 
Koramangala Layout (OG) 
R.M. Vilas II Stage (OG) 
Kadirenahalli (OG) 
Jakkasandra (OG) 
Gangondanahalli (OG) 
Binnamangala 



Manavarthekaval (OG) 
Kengeri Satelite Town (OG) 
Nagashettihalli (OG) 
Kengere (OG) 
Hongasandra (OG) 
Bommanahalli (OG) 
Sarakki Kere (OG) 
Hosakere Halli (OG) 
Yelachenaballi (OG) 
Bilekahalli (OG) 
Singasandra (OG) 
Nayanadahalli (OG) 
Roopena Agrahara (OG) 
Jaraganahalli (OG) 
Chikkalasandra (OG) 
Ittamadu (OG) 
Hulimavi (OG) 
Agara (OG) 
Pantarapalya (OG) 
Bhoopasandra (OG) 
Yellukunte (OG) 
Nagadevanahalli (OG) 
Channasandra (OG) 
Lottegollahalli (OG) 
Kenchenahalli (OG) 
Mallatbahalli (OG) 
Arakeri (OG) 
Valagerahalli (OG) (excluding Kenge Satellite Town) 
Poornapura (OG) 
Kathriguppe (OG) 
Puttenahalli (OG) 
Halagavadarahalli (OG) 
Halagavadarahalli (OG) 
Patnagere (OG) 
Mylasandra (OG) 
Nagarabavi (OG) 
Venkogiraokane (OG) 
Hosur-Sarjapura Layout (OG) 
Bikesipura (OG) 
Madivala (OG) 
Choodenapura (OG) 
Gurihodevo Maidana (OG) 
HA Sanitary Board 
HA Sanitary Board (SB) (excluding HAL township) 
Sl.No. Name of the Place Population 
79 
Munnekolala (OG) 
White Field (OG) 
Pattandur (OG) 
Kundalahalli (OG) 
Nallurahalli (OG) 



Chinnappanahalli (OG) 
Sennenahalli (OG) 
AECs Layout (OG) 
Srinivasapura (OG) 
ITI Notified Area 
I.T.I. Notified area (NAC) 
Hoodi (OG) 
Battahalli (OG) 
Madihalli (OG) 
Kodigehalli (OG) 
Devarajivanahalli (NMCT) 
Kalagondanahalli 
Kalagondanahalli (NMCT) 
HBR I Stage (OG) (including Pillanna Garden III Stage) 
Hennur (OG) 
Yelahanka 
Yelahanka (TMC) 
Yelahanka (OG) 
Hunasamaranahalli (OG) 
Allalasandra (OG) 
Puttenahalli (OG) 
Vaderapura (OG) 
Venkatala (OG) 
Suggatta (OG) 
Shivanahalli (OG) 
Dasarahalli 
Dasarahalli (NMCT) 
Mallasandra (OG) 
K.G. Bagalakunte (OG) 
Chikkebidarakallu (OG) 
Kacharkanhalli 
HPBR Layout (OG) 
Kacharakanahalli (NMCT) 
BEL Township 
Doddabammasandra (OG) 
BEL Township (NMCT) 
Kodagehalli (OG) 
Singapur (OG) 
Ramachandrapura (OG) 
M.D. Sabarapalya 
(Jarakabanadekaval) (OG) 
Sl.No. Name of the Place Population 
80 
Thindlu (OG) 
Narasipura (OG) 
Kodagehalli Plantation (OG) 
Koramangala 
Koramangala (NMCT) 
Ejipura (OG) 
Srinivagilu (OG) 
Laggere 



Laggere (NMCT) 
Hegganahali (OG) 
Nallakadarenahalli (OG) 
Sangeguruvanahalli 
Sanguruvanahalli (NCT) 
Srigandadakaval (OG) 
Peenya 
Peenya (NMCT) 
Chokkasandra (OG) 
Peenya Plantation (OG) 
Nagasandra (OG) 
Nagavara 
HBR II Stage (OG) 
Nagavara (NMCT) 
Shampura (OG) 
Viginapura (NMCT) 
Banasavadi 
OMBER Layout (OG) 
East of NGEF Layout (OG) 
Banasavadi (NMCT) 
Hebbal 
Hebbal (NMCT) 
Amruthahalli (OG) 
Byatarayanapura (OG) 
Kothihosahalli (OG) 
Kempapura (OG) 
Hebbal Amanikere (OG) 
Byatarayanapura (NMCT) 
(B. Narayanapura) 
Lingarajapura (NMCT) 
HAL Township (NMCT) 
Baiyyappanahalli (Vimanapura) 
Baiyyappanahalli Vimanapura (NMCT) 
Baiyyappanahalli Manavarthekaval (OG) 
Sl.No. Name of the Place Population 
81 
Kamagondanahalli (NMCT) 
HMT Township 
HMT Township (NMCT) 
Gangammanagudipalya (OG) 
Jalahalli (NMCT) (excluding the area as under Bangalroe 
(MC) BEL Township and HMT (Township) 
Kavalbyrasandra (NMCT) 
Geddalahalli (NMCT) 
Byataguttepalya (NMCT) 
Mahadevapura (NMCT) 
Benniganahalli (NMCT) 
HMT Watch Factory Township (NMCT) 
2. Mysore Urban Agglomeration 6,52,246 
(a) Mysore 
Mysore (MC0 



Malalavadi (OG) 
Devanoor (OG) 
Kurubarahalli (OG) 
Bhogadi (OG) 
Hebbalu (OG) 
Hinkal (OG) 
Datagahallii (OG) 
Metagalli (OG) 
Srirampura (OG) 
Yeraganahalli (OG) 
Maragondanahalli (OG) 
Alanahalli (OG) 
Hutagalli (OG) 
Iranagere (OG) 
Chikkaharandanahalli (OG) 
Vijayasripura (OG) 
Kukkarahalli (OG) 
Kyathamaranahalli (NMCT) 
Kyathamaranahalli (NMCT) 
Satagalli (OG) 
Mysore (Non-Municipal Area) 
Nachanahalli (OG) 
Mysore (Non-Municipal Area) 
Chamundi Betta 
Chamundi Betta Notified Area (NAC) 
Chamundi Betta (OG) 
3. Hubli Dharwad (MC) Dharwad 6,47,640 
4. Mangalore Urban Agglomeration D.K. 4,25,785 
Mangalore 
Sl.No. Name of the Place Population 
82 
Mangalore (MC) 
Bangre Area (OG) 
Surathkal 
Surathkal (TMC) 
Katipalla (OG) 
Kulai (OG) 
Hosabetta (OG) 
Ullal (NMCT) 
Somehwar (NMCT) 
Peramunnur (NMCT) 
Kotckar (NMCT) 
New Mangalore Port 
New Mangalore Port (NMCT) 
Baikampady (OG) 
Panambur (OG) 
Tannirbavi (OG) 
Bajal (NMCT) 
Kannur (NMCT) 
5. Belgaum Urban Agglomeration Belgaum 4,01,619 
Belgaum 



Belgaum (MC) 
Kakati (OG) 
Peeranawadi (OG) 
Matche (OG) 
Kangradi (KH) (OG) 
Kangradi (BK) (OG) 
Benakanahalli (OG) 
Belgaum Rural (OG) 
Belgaum Contonment (CB) 
Hindalge (NMCT) 
6. Gulbarga Urban Agglomeration 3,09,962 
Gulbarga (MC) 
Rajapura (OG) 
Badepur (OG) 
Brahmpur (OG) 
Biddapur (OG) 
7. Davangere Urban Aggiomeration 2,87,114 
Davangere (CMC) 
S (OG) 
Avaregere (OG) 
Nittuhalli (OG) 
8. Bellary (CMC) 2,45,758 
9. Bijapur Urban Agglomeration 1,93,038 
Bijapur (CMC) 
Mahalbagayat (OG) 
Sl.No. Name of the Place Population 
83 
10. Shimoga Urban Agglomeration 1,92,647 
Shimoga (CMC) 
Harige (OG) 
Navile (OG) 
Mandali (OG) 
Gopala (OG) 
Islapur (OG) 
Mulkere (OG) 
Kallahalli (G) 
Venkatapura (OG) 
Shimoga Rural (OG) 
11. Tumkur Urban Agglomeration 1,79,497 
Tumkur (CMC) 
Kyathasandra (OG) 
Maralur (OG) 
Devarayapatna (OG) 
Settihalli (OG) 
Batavade (OG) 
Baddihalli (OG) 
Upparahalli (OG) 
Tumkur Kasaba (OG) 
Veerasagara (OG) 
Channadinne (OG) 
12. Raichur Urban Agglomeration 1,70,500 



Raichur (CMC) 
Rampur (OG) 
Askihal (OG) 
Postgal (OG) 
Yermaras (OG) 
13. Kolar Gold Fields Urban Agglomeration 1,56,398 
Kolar Gold Fields (SB) 
Robertsonpet (CMC) 
B.E.M.L. Nagar 
B.E.M.L. Nagar (NMCT) 
Chinnakote (OG) 
Dasarahosahalli (OG) 
Doddur Karpanahalli Plantation (OG) 
Kathihalli (OG) 
Devaganahalli (OG) 
14. Bhadravathi Urban Agglomeration Shimoga 1,49,131 
Bhadravathi New Town 
Bhadravathi New Town (NAC) 
Bommanakatte (OG) 
Kadadakatte (OG) 
Kavalgundi (OG) 
Sl.No. Name of the Place Population 
84 
Bhadravathi 
Bhadravathi (YMC) 
Seegebagi (OG) 
Kanakatte (OG) 
Kabalikate (OG) 
Kodihalli (OG) 
15. Hospet Urban Agglomeration 1,34,935 
Hospet 
Hospet (CMC) 
Hospet 
Ananthasayanagudi (OG) 
Kariganur (OG) 
Sankalapura (OG) 
Amaravathi (TMC) 
16. Gada-Betgeri (CMC) 1,33,918 
17. Bidar Urban (Agglomeration) 1,30,804 
Bidar (CMC) 
Mailur (OG) 
Chidri (OG) 
Nowbad (OG) 
Kumbarwada (OG) 
Aliabad (OG) 
Haladkeri (OG) 
Janagalkoi (OG) 
Mohilat (OG) 
Mohilat-e-Gairabi (OG) 
Bagh-e-Kargnja (OG) 
Sari Champa (OG) 



Gullex Haveri (OG) 
18. Mandya (CMC) 1,19,970 
19. Udupi Urban Agglomeration-DK 1,17,744 
Udupi 
Udupi (TMC) 
Shivalli (OG) 
Haraga (OG) 
Kadiyoor (OG) 
Kadekar (OG) 
Kuthpady (OG) 
Sl.No. Name of the Place Population 
85 
Ambaipady (OG) 
Moodanidambur (OG) 
Malpe (MP) 
BAdagabettu-76 (MMCI) 
Puttur (MMCI) 
20. Hassan Urban Agglomeration Hassan 1,08, 
Hassan (CMC) 
Satyamangala (OG) 
Haralahalli (OG) 
Chikkakondagula (OG) 
B. Kattihalli (OG) 
Thamalapura (OG) 
Chikkamandiganahalli (OG) 
Chikkahonnenahalli (OG) 
Aduvali (OG) 
Biranahalli (OG) 
Hassan (OG) 
21. Chitradurga Urban Agglomeration 1,03,345 
(Chitradurga) 
Chitradurga (CMC) 
Kalagoie (OG) 
Madehalli (OG) 
22. Kolar (CMC) 83,19 
23. Gangawati Urban Agglomeration Raichur 81,108 
Gangawati (TMC) 
Gangawati (OG) 
Waddarahatti (OG) 
24. Bagalkot (CMC) Bijapur 76,819 
25. Ranibennur (CMC) Dharwad 67,419 
26. Harihar (TMC) Chitradruga 66,660 
27. Chickmagalur (CMC) 60,607 
28. Rabkavi Bankatti (TMC) - Bijapur 60,607 
Sl.No. Name of the Place Population 
86 
29. Channapatna (TMC) Bangalore Rural 55,210 
30. Doddaballapur (TMC)-Bangalore Rural 54,468 
31. Dandeli (CM) Uttar Kannada 52,699 
32. Shahabad Urban Agglomeration Gulbarga 52,534 
Shahabad (TMC) 



Shahabad A.C.C. (NAC) 
33. Gokak (TMC) Belgaum 52,037 
34. Nipani (CMC) Belgaum 51,622 
35. Karwar (CMC) Uttara Kannada 51,011 
36. Sirsi Urban Agglemeration U.K. 50,899 
Sisri (TMC) 
Sirsi (OG) 
Puttanamare (OG) 
Landakanahalli (OG) 
Kalkuni (OG) 
37. Ramanagaram (TMC) Bangalore Rural 50,411 
38. Chintamani (TMC) 50,376 
39. Madikeri (TMC) 28,329 
P. RAMANATH, 
Under Secretary to Government-I, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 18-6-1994 
Sl.No. Name of the Place Population 
87 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 04 SRR 95, Bangalore, dated 25th July 1995 
Whereas the draft of the rules further to amend the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) Rules, 1977 was published as required by sub-section 2(a) of Section 3 of 
the Karnataka 
State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Act No. 14 of 1990) in Notification No. DPAR 4 SRR 95, 
dated 26th 
April, 1995 in Part-IV section 2c(i) of the Karnataka Gazette dated 8th June, 1995 
inviting objections 
and suggestions from persons likely to be affected thereby within thirty days from the 
date of the 
publication of the draft in the Official Gazette. 
Whereas the said Gazette was made available to the public on 8th June 1995. 
And whereas no objections and suggestions received has been considered by the State 
Government. 
Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of Section 3 read 
with Section-8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Karnataka Act No. 14 of 
1990) the 
Government of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules, namely:- 
RULES 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Forty Fourth Amendment) Rules, 1995. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of the Karnataka Civil Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977:- In 
the 
Karnataka Civil Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977,- 
(1) In Rule 2, - 
(i) clause (d) shall be omitted; 
(ii) in sub-rule (1), after clause (1), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:- 



"(1-1) "Other Backward Classes" means the persons belonging to the classes or 
categories lassified as,- 
(i) Category-I (Most Backward), 
(ii) Category-II (a) (Relatively More Backward); 
(iii) Category-II (b) (More Backward) 
(iv) Cateogry-III (a) (Backward) 
(v) Category-III (b) (Relatively Backward) 
by the Government under Article 16(4) of the Constitution of India in Order No. SWD 150 
BCA 94, 
dated 17th September, 1994 read with G.O. No. SWD 251 BCA 94, dated 31st January, 
1995 and 
as amended from time to time." 
(2) In rule 6,- 
88 
(i) in sub-rule (1), for sub-clauses (a), (b) and (c) and the last para, the following shall be 
substituted, namely:- 
"(a) thirty-eight years in the case of a person belonging to any of the Scheduled Castes 
or Scheduled Tribes or Category-I of ther Backward Classes; 
(b) thirty-six years in the case of a person belonging to any of the Category-II (a0 or II (b) 
or III (a) or III (b) of other Backward Classes; and 
(c) thirty-three years in the case of any other person. 
on the last date fixed for the receipt of applications or on such other date, as may be 
specified by 
the Appointing Authority". 
(ii) for sub-rule (2), the following shall be substituted, namely:- 
"(2) Where maximum age limits other than age limits specified in sub-rule (1) are fixed 
for recruitment for any service or post then unless the rules of recruitment provided for 
enchanced 
age limit in the case of a person belonging to Scheduled Castes, Scheduled Tribes, 
Category-I, 
Category-II(a), Category-II(b), Category-III (a), Category-III(b) of other Backward 
Classes, the 
maximum age limits shall be deemed to have been enhanced by five years in the case 
of a candidate 
belonging to any of the Scheduled Castes or Scheduled Tribes or Category-I of other 
Backward 
Classes and by three years in the case of a candidates belonging to any of the 
Category-II(a) or 
Category-II(b) or Category-III (a) or Category-III(b) of other Backward Classes". 
(3) In rule 13, in the first proviso for the words "Backward Group-A", the words 
"Cateogry- 
I" shall be substituted. 
3. Amendment of the Karnataka Recruitment of Gazetted Probationers 
(Appointment 
by Competitive Examinations Rules, 1966.- In the Karnataka Recruitment of Gazetted 
Probationers (Appointment by Competitive Examinations) Rules, 1966,- 
(1) in the first proviso to rule 5, for the words "a Backward Group-A and by three years 
if a candidate belongs to any of the Backward Group-B, Backward Group-C or Backward 
Group- 
D", the words "Category-I of other Backward Classes and by three years if a candidate 
belongs to 



Category-II(a) or Category-II(b) or Category-III(a) or Category-III (b) of other Backward 
Classes" 
shall be substituted. 
(2) in rule 7, 9 and 10 the words "Backward Group-A" wherever they occur shall be 
omitted. 
4. Amendment of the Karnataka State Civil Services (Direct Recruitment by 
Selection 
Rules, 1973.- In the Karnataka State Civil Services (Direct Recruitment by Selection) 
Rules, 1973 
in rule 5 and 7 the words "Backward Group-A" shall be omitted. 
5. Amendment of the Karnataka Civil Services (Recruitment to the Ministerial 
Posts) 
Rules, 1978.- In the Karnataka Civil Services (Recruitment to the Ministerial Posts), 
Rules, 1978,- 
(1) In sub-rule (1) of rule 7, for the words "Backward Group-A and other Categories of 
Backward Classes in accordance with the Government Order No. DPAR 28 SBC 86, 
dated 12th 
December, 1986 as amended from time to time", the words "and Other Backward 
Classes as 
specified by the Government from time to time under Article 16(4) of the Constitution of 
India" shall 
be substituted 
89 
(2) In rule 10, for the words "the Government Order No. DPAR 28 SBC 86, dated 12th 
December, 1986 as amended from time to time", occuring in two places, the words "the 
Reservation 
orders in force from time to time" shall be substituted. 
6. Amendment of other rules.- (1) In any rules other than the rules amended in Rules 
2, 3, 
4 and 5 of these rules, made or deemed to have been mae under the Karnataka State 
Civil Services 
Act, 1978 (Karnataka Act 14 of 1990),- 
(i) for the words "Backward Group-A" the words "Category-I of other Backward Classes" 
shall be substituted; 
(ii) for the words "Backward Group-B, Backward Group-C and Backward Group-D" the 
words "Category-II (a), Category-II (b), Category-III (a) and Category-III (b) of other 
Backward Classes" 
shall be substituted; 
(iii) any reference to Government Order No. SWL 66 BCA 86, dated 13th October, 1986 
shall be contrued as reference to Government Order No. SWD 150 BCA 94, dated 17th 
September, 
1994 read with Government Order No. SWD 251 BCA 94, dated 31st January, 1995 and 
as may be 
amended from time to time. 
(2) In the Orders, Schedules, Notifications, Regulations or Instructions, in force, 
immediately prior to the commencement of these rules,- 
(i) any reference to the "Backward Group-A" shall be construed to be reference to the, 
'Category-I of other Backward Classes"; 
(ii) any reference to "Backwrd Group-B, Backward Group-C and Backward Group-D" 
shall be construed to be "Category-II (a) Category-II (b), Category-III (a) and Category-III 
(b) of other 



Backward Classes"; 
(iii) all references to "Backward Group-E" shall be deleted. 
7. Savings.- Notwithstanding anything contained in the rules, all recrutiments, the 
process 
of which had commenced prior to the date of coming into force of these rules, shall be 
processed 
and completed, as if the rules amended under these rules have not been amended. 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
P. RAMANATH, 
Under Secretary to Government-I, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 10-8-1995 
90 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 28 SRR 95, Bangalore, dated 21stth July 1995 October, 1995 
Whereas the draft of the rules further to amend the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) Rules, 1977 was published as required by sub-section 2(a) of Section 3 of 
the Karnataka 
State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Act No. 14 of 1990) in Notification No. DPAR 28 SRR 95, 
dated 18th 
August, 1995 in Part-IV section 2c(i) of the Karnataka Gazette dated 31st August, 1995 
inviting 
objections and suggestions from persons likely to be affected thereby within thirty days 
from the 
date of the publication of the draft in the Official Gazette. 
Whereas the said Gazette was made available to the public on 31st August, 1995. 
And whereas no objections and suggestions received has been considered by the State 
Government. 
Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of Section 3 read 
with Section-8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Karnataka Act No. 14 of 
1990) the 
Government of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules, namely:- 
RULES 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Forty Fifth Amendment) Rules, 1995. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of rule 9.- In rule 9 of the said rules,- (1) in sub-rule (1), for the words 
"the 
percetnage or number of vacancies set apart for that method shall be reduced by ten 
percent or by 
such number as is equal to ten percent of the vacancies and the percentage or number 
so reduced", 
the words "ten eprcentage of the vacancies set apart for that method in each of the 
categories of 
general merit, Scheduled Castes and Scheduled Tribes and in each of the categories 
among other 
backward classes shall be reserved for, and" shall be substituted. 



(2) in sub-rule (1A) for the words "the percentage or number of vacancies set apart for 
that method shall be reduced by four percent or by such number as is equal to four 
percent of the 
vacancies in addition to the vacancies to be reduced under sub-rule (1) and the 
percentage or 
number so reduced", the words "five percentage of the vacancies set apart for that 
method in each 
of the categories of general merit, Scheduled Castes and Scheduled Tribes and in each 
of the 
categories among their backward classes shall be reserved for, and" shall be 
substituted. 
(3) sub-rule (3) shall be omitted. 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
P. RAMANATH, 
Under Secretary to Government-I, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 2-11-1995 
91 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 34 SRR 95, Bangalore, dated 6th March 1996 
Whereas the draft of the rules further to amend the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) Rules, 1977 was published as required by clause (a) of sub-section (2) of 
Section 3 
read with Section 8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Act No. 14 of 1990) 
in Notification 
No. DPAR 34 SRR 95, dated 24th November, 1995 in Part-IV section 2c(i) of the 
Karnataka Gazette 
dated 7th December, 1995 inviting objections and suggestions from persons likely to be 
affected 
thereby within thirty days from the date of the publication of the draft in the Official 
Gazette. 
Whereas the said Gazette was made available to the public on 7th December, 1995. 
And whereas no objections and suggestions received has been considered by the State 
Government. 
Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of Section 3 read 
with Section-8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Karnataka Act No. 14 of 
1990) the 
Government of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules, namely:- 
RULES 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Forty sixth Amendment) Rules, 1996. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of rule 9.- In rule 9 of the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) 
Rules, 1977, after sub-rule (1A), the following sub-rule shall be inserted, namely:- 
"(1B) Notwithstanding anything contained in the rules of recruitment specially made in 
respect of any service or post, in all direct recruitment thirty percent of vacancies set 



apart for that 
method in each of vacancies set apart for that method in each of the categories of 
General Merit, 
Scheduled Castes, Scheduled Tribes and in each of the categories among other 
backward classes 
shall, subject to any general instructions that may be issued by the Government 
regarding the 
manner of appointment, be filled from among women candidates; 
Provided that if sufficient number of eligible women candidates are not available, to the 
extent of thirty percent, the unfilled vacancies shall be filled by men candidates 
belonging to the 
same category; 
Provided further that nothing in this rule shall prevent the women candidates from 
competing and for being considered against seventy percent of direct recruitment 
vacancies, if 
selected on the basis of merit". 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
S. DEVAKAR, 
Under Secretary to Government-I, I/C, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 6-3-1996 
92 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 16 SRR 95, Bangalore, dated 15th March 1996 
Whereas the draft of the rules further to amend the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) Rules, 1977 was published as required by sub-section (2) (a) of Section 3 
of the 
Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Act No. 14 of 1990) in Notification No. DPAR 
16 SRR 95, 
dated 6th January, 1996 in Part-IV section 2c(i) of the Karnataka Gazette dated 12th 
January, 1996 
inviting objections and suggestions from persons likely to be affected thereby within 
thirty days 
from the date of the publication of the draft in the Official Gazette. 
Whereas the said Gazette was made available to the public on 12th January, 1996. 
And whereas no objections and suggestions received has been considered by the State 
Government. 
Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of Section 3 read 
with Section-8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Karnataka Act No. 14 of 
1990) the 
Government of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules, namely:- 
RULES 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Forty Seventh Amendment) Rules, 1996. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of Rule 2.- In clause (mm) of sub-rule (1) of rule 2 of the Karnataka Civil 
Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 (hereinafter referred to as the said rules, 



after the 
word "studied", the words "in the State of Karnataka" shall be inserted. 
3. Amendment of Rule 3B.- The sub-clause (i) of rule 3B of the said rules shall be 
substituted as follows:- 
(i) Five percent shall be added to the percentage of marks secured in the: 
(a) qualifying examination where the selection is based upon the marks secured in the 
qualifying examination; 
(b) qualifying examination where the selection is based upon the marks secured in the 
qualifying examination and interview; 
(c) competitive examination or in the competitive examinations and interview/viva-voce, 
as the case may be, where the selection is based upon marks secured in the 
competitive examination or in the competitive examination and interview/viva-voce". 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
K.L. Jayaram, 
Under Secretary to Government-II, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette 15-3-1996 
93 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 37 SRR 91, Bangalore, dated 27th July 1996 
Whereas the draft of the rules further to amend the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) Rules, 1977 was published as required by clause (a) of sub-section (2) of 
Section 3 
read with Section 8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Act No. 14 of 1990) 
in Notification 
No. DPAR 37 SRR 91, dated 9th June, 1996 in Part-IV section 2c(i) of the Karnataka 
Gazette dated 
6th June, 1996 inviting objections and suggestions from persons likely to be affected 
thereby within 
thirty days from the date of the publication of the draft in the Official Gazette. 
Whereas the said Gazette was made available to the public on 6th June, 1996. 
And whereas no objections and suggestions received has been considered by the State 
Government. 
Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of Section 3 read 
with Section-8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Karnataka Act No. 14 of 
1990) the 
Government of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules, namely:- 
RULES 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Forty Eighth Amendment) Rules, 1996. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of rule 5.- In rule 5 of the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) 
Rules, 1977, after sub-rule (5),- 
(i) after the words "in any language" the words "with kannada as one of the subjects" 
shall 
be inserted; 



(ii) for the words "as a peon" and "as peon " the words to a Group-D post shall be 
substituted. 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
M. VENKATARAMAIAH, 
Under Secretary to Government-I, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 10-10-1996 
94 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 59 SRR 96, Bangalore, dated 28th April, 1997 
Whereas the draft of the rules further to amend the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) Rules, 1977 was published as required by clause (a) of sub-section (2) of 
Section 3 
read with Section 8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Act No. 14 of 1990) 
in Notification 
No. DPAR 59 SRR 96, dated 18th October, 1996 in Part-IV section 2c(i) of the 
Karnataka Gazette 
dated 14th November, 1966, inviting objections and suggestions from persons likely to 
be affected 
thereby within thirty days from the date of the publication of the draft in the Official 
Gazette. 
Whereas the said Gazette was made available to the public on 14th November, 1996. 
And whereas no objections and suggestions received has been considered by the State 
Government. 
Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of Section 3 read 
with Section-8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Karnataka Act No. 14 of 
1990) the 
Government of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules, namely:- 
RULES 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Forty ninth Amendment) Rules, 1997. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of rule 2.- In sub-clause (1) of clause (mm) of sub-rule (1) of rule 2 of 
the 
Karnataka Civil Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 (hereinafter referred to as 
the said 
rules), the words "and passed SSLC" shall be omitted. 
3. Amendment of rule 3B.- In sub-rule (1) of Rule 3B of the said rules,- 
(i) for the words "Group-C" and Group-D posts, the words "any of the posts" shall be 
substituted; 
(ii) in sub-clauses (i) and (ii) for the wors "Five per cent", the words "Ten percent" shall 
be 
substituted. 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
M. VENKATARAMAIAH, 
Under Secretary to Government-I, 



Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 28-4-1997 
95 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
NOTIFICATION 
NO. DPAR 75 SRR 96, Bangalore, dated 5th December 1997 
Whereas the draft of the rules further to amend the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) Rules, 1977 was published as required by sub-section 2(a) of Section 3 of 
the Karnataka 
State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Act No. 14 of 1990) in Notification No. DPAR 75 SRR 96, 
dated 27th 
September,1996 in Part-IV section 2c(i) of the Karnataka Gazette dated 23rd October, 
1997 inviting 
objections and suggestions from persons likely to be affected thereby within thirty days 
from the 
date of the publication of the draft in the Official Gazette. 
Whereas the said Gazette was made available to the public on 23rd October 1997. 
And whereas no objections and suggestions have been received by the State 
Government. 
Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of Section 3 read 
with Section 8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Karnataka Act No. 14 of 
1990) the 
Government of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules, namely:- 
RULES 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Fiftieth Amendment) Rules, 1997. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of rule 2.- In rule 2 of the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) 
Rules, 1977, in sub-rule (1), the following proviso shall be added to clause (mm), 
namely:- 
"Provided that where a student who has been admitted directly to any standard other 
than 
first standard in accordance with the provisions of the Compulsory Primary Education 
Act, 1961, 
and has studied upto qualifying examination or upto the 10th standard, as the case may 
be, in a 
school situated in an area or towns other than the areas or towns specified in the 
schedule shall 
also be considered as Rural Candidate under this rule". 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
M. VENKATARAMAIAH 
Under Secretary to Government-I, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 6-12-1997 
96 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 



NOTIFICATION 
NO. DPAR 44 SRR 94, Bangalore, dated 21st Janauary 1998 
Whereas the draft of the rules further to amend the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) Rules, 1977 was published as required by sub-section 2(a) of Section 3 of 
the Karnataka 
State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Act No. 14 of 1990) in Notification No. DPAR 44 SRR 96, 
dated 16th 
October, 1997 in Part-IV section 2c(i) of the Karnataka Gazette dated 4th December, 
1999 inviting 
objections and suggestions from persons likely to be affected thereby within thirty days 
from the 
date of the publication of the draft in the Official Gazette. 
Whereas the said Gazette was made available to the public on 4th December, 1997. 
And whereas no objections and suggestions have been received by the State 
Government. 
Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of Section 3 read 
with Section 8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Karnataka Act No. 14 of 
1990) the 
Government of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules, namely:- 
RULES 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Fifty First Amendment) Rules, 1998. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of rule 16.- In rule 16 of the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) 
Rules, 1977, in clause (a) for the proviso to sub-clause (ii), the following shall be 
substituted namely:- 
"Provided that appointment by transfer under this sub-clause shall not be made unless 
the officer his issued the examination proviso under the Karantaka Civil Services 
(Service and 
Kannada Language Examinations) Rules, ..... for thepost to which is proposed to be 
transferred". 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
M. VENKATARAMAIAH 
Under Secretary to Government-I, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 23-1-1998 
97 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
NOTIFICATION 
NO. DPAR 48 SRR 97, Bangalore, dated 28th April, 1998 
Whereas the draft of the rules further to amend the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) Rules, 1977 was published as required by sub-section 2(o) of Section 8 of 
the Karnataka 
State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Act No. 14 of 1990) in Notification No. DPAR 48 SRR 97, 
dated 10th 
March,1998 in Part-IV section 2c(i) of the Karnataka Gazette dated 12th March, 1998 
nviting objections 



and suggestions from persons likely to be affected thereby within thirty days from the 
date of the 
publication of the draft in the Official Gazette. 
Whereas the said Gazette was made available to the public on 12th March, 1998. 
And whereas no objections and suggestions have been received by the State 
Government. 
Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of Section 3 read 
with Section 8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Karnataka Act No. 14 of 
1990) the 
Government of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules, namely:- 
RULES 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Fifty Second Amendment) Rules, 1998. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of Schedule.- In the Schedule appended to the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) Rules, 1977- 
(i) in the heading "the words" and / or which is a District Head Quarters" shall be 
omitted; 
(ii) serial number 39 and the entries relating thereto shall be omitted. 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
M. VENKATARAMAIAH 
Under Secretary to Government-I, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 2-5-1998 
98 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
NOTIFICATION 
NO. DPAR 09 SRR 98, Bangalore, dated 3rd July, 1999 
Whereas the draft of the rules further to amend the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) Rules, 1977 was published as required by sub-section 2(a) of Section 3 of 
the Karnataka 
State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Act No. 14 of 1990) in Notification No. DPAR 09 SRR 98, 
dated 30th 
April 1999 in Part-IV section 2c(i) of the Karnataka Gazette Extraordinary dated 12th 
May 1999 
inviting objections and suggestions from persons likely to be affected thereby within 
thirty days 
from the date of the publication of the draft in the Official Gazette. 
Whereas the said Gazette was made available to the public on 12th May 1999. 
And whereas no objections and suggestions have been received by the State 
Government. 
Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of Section 3 read 
with Section 8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Karnataka Act No. 14 of 
1990) the 
Government of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules, namely:- 
RULES 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 



Services 
(General Recruitment) (Fifty third Amendment) Rules, 1999. 
(2) They shall be deemed to have come into force with effect from the twenty fifth day of 
March, 1998. 
2. Amendment of rule 6.- In rule 6 of the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) 
Rules, 1977, in sub-rule (3), after clause (i), the the following shall be inserted namely:- 
"(k) in the case of a candidate for appointment to a Group-'B', Group-'C' or Group-'D' 
post 
in the Office of the Resident Commissioner, New Delhi and the Karnataka Bhavan, New 
Delhi, by 
eight years". 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
M. VENKATARAMAIAH 
Under Secretary to Government-I, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 3-7-1999 
99 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
NOTIFICATION 
NO. DPAR 52 SRR 98, Bangalore, dated 7th December 1999 
Whereas the draft of the rules further to amend the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) Rules, 1977 was published as required by sub-section 2(a) of Section 3 of 
the Karnataka 
State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Act No. 14 of 1990) in Notification No. DPAR 52 SRR 98, 
dated 8th 
July 1999 in Part-IV section 2c(ii) of the Karnataka Gazette dated 14th July 1999 inviting 
objections 
and suggestions from persons likely to be affected thereby within thirty days from the 
date of the 
publication of the draft in the Official Gazette. 
Whereas the said Gazette was made available to the public on 4th July 1999. 
And whereas no objections and suggestions were received. 
Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of Section 3 read 
with Section 8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Karnataka Act No. 14 of 
1990) the 
Government of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules, namely:- 
RULES 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Fifty Fourth Amendment) Rules, 1999. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of rule 9.- In sub-rule (1B) of rule 9 of the Karantaka Civil Services 
(General 
Recruitment) Rules, 1977, after the second proviso, the following proviso shall be 
inserted namely:- 
"Provided also that the Government may, by Notification exclude any service or post 
from 
the application of the provision of this sub-rule," 



By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
S. CHANDRASHEKARAPPA 
Under Secretary to Government-I, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 7-12-1999 
100 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
NOTIFICATION 
NO. DPAR 30 SRR 99, Bangalore, dated 9th June 2000 
Whereas the draft of the rules further to amend the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) Rules, 1977 was published as required by sub-section 2(a) of Section 3 of 
the Karnataka 
State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Act No. 14 of 1990) in Notification No. DPAR 30 SRR 99, 
dated 21st 
August 1999 in Part-IV section 2c(i) of the Karnataka Gazette dated 25th August 1999 
inviting 
objections and suggestions from persons likely to be affected thereby within thirty days 
from the 
date of the publication of the draft in the Official Gazette. 
Whereas the said Gazette was made available to the public on 25th August 1999. 
And whereas no objections and suggestions received have been considered. 
Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of Section 3 read 
with Section 8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Karnataka Act No. 14 of 
1990) the 
Government of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules, namely:- 
RULES 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Fifty Fifth Amendment) Rules, 2000. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of rule 16.- In rule 16 of the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) 
Rules, 1977, in clause (a), after sub-clause (iv), the following proviso shall be inserted, 
namely:- 
"Provided that where the Government is of the opinion that in view of the special 
circumstances of a case the period of deputation has to be extended beyond five years 
as stipulated 
under this clause, it may, for reasons to be recorded in writing, extend the same for a 
further period 
of one year at a time subject to a maximum of three years, so however, that the total 
period of 
deputation including the extended period shall not exceed eight years". 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
S. CHANDRASHEKARAPPA, 
Under Secretary to Government-I, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 14-6-2000 



101 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
NOTIFICATION 
No. DPAR 14 SRR 2000, dated 11th October, 2000 
Whereas the draft of the following rules further to amend the Karnataka Civil Services 
(General 
Recruitment) Rules, 1977 was published as required by clause (a) of sub-section (2) of 
section 3 
read with section 8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Karnataka Act 14 of 
1990) in 
Notification No. DPAR 14 SRR 2000 dated 31-8-2000 in part IV-A of the Karnataka 
Gazette 
extraordinary dated 31-8-2000 inviting objections and suggestions from persons likely to 
be affected 
thereby within thirty days from the date of the publication of the draft in the official 
gazette. 
Whereas the said draft was made available to the public on 31-8-2000. 
And whereas the objections and suggestions received in this behalf have been 
considered by 
the State Government. 
Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of section 3 read 
with 
section 8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 ( Karnataka Act 14 of 1990) the 
Government 
of Karnataka hereby make the following rules, namely: 
RULES 
1. Title, Commencement and Application :- (1) These rules may be called the 
Karnataka 
Civil Services (General recruitment) (Fifty Sixth Amendment) Rules, 2000. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of Rule 15 :- In Rule 15 of the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) 
Rules, 1977, - 
(i) in sub-rule (1), in clause (b), after sub-clause (v), the following shall be inserted, 
namely 
:- 
“(vi) Posts of Personal Assistants, Second Division Assistants, Drivers and 
Group ‘D’ posts sanctioned in Revenue Department for assisting the Members 
of Parliament and any other post which may be sanctioned in Revenue 
Department for the said purpose”. 
(ii) In the proviso to sub-rule (2),- 
“(i) after the words, brackets and figures “sub-clause (iii)” the words, brackets and 
figures “and sub-clause (vi)” shall be inserted; and 
(ii) for the words “or the Deputy Minister concerned” the words “the Deputy Minister 
or the Member of Parliament concerned” shall be substituted. 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
S. CHANDRASHEKARAPPA, 
Under Secretary to Government-I, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 



Published in Gazette dated 11-10-2000 
102 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
NOTIFICATION 
NO. DPAR 23 SRR 99, Bangalore, dated 23rd November 2000 
Whereas the draft of the rules further to amend the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) Rules, 1977 was published as required by sub-section 2(a) of Section 3 of 
the Karnataka 
State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Act No. 14 of 1990) in Notification No. DPAR 23 SRR 96, 
dated 22nd 
July 2000 in Part-IVA of the Karnataka Gazette dated 22nd July 2000 inviting objections 
and 
suggestions from persons likely to be affected thereby within thirty days from the date of 
the 
publication of the draft in the Official Gazette. 
Whereas the said Gazette was made available to the public on 22nd July 2000. 
And whereas no objections and suggestions received in this behalf have been 
considered 
by the State Government. 
Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of Section 3 read 
with Section 8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Karnataka Act No. 14 of 
1990) the 
Government of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules, namely:- 
RULES 
1. Title and Commencement.- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Fifty Seventh Amendment) Rules, 2000. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of rule 9.- In rule 9 of the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) 
Rules, 1977. 
(i) in the heading, for the words "and physically handicapped", a comma and the words 
"physically handicapped and members of the family of a project displaced person", shall 
be 
substituted; 
(ii) after sub-rule (1A), the following shall be inserted, namely:- 
"(1AA) Notwithstanding anything contained in the rules of recruitment specially made in 
resepct of any service or post, if in such rules of recruitment direct recruitment is 
prescribed as 
one of the methods of recruitment, for a period of twenty years from the date of 
commencement of 
the Karnataka Civil Services (General Recruitment) (Fifth Seventh Amendment) Rules, 
2000, five 
percent of the posts set apart for that method in each of the categories of General Merit, 
Scheduled 
Castes and Scheduled Tribes and in each of the categories among other Backward 
Classes, shall 
be filled by direct recruitment from among the members of the family of a project 
displaced person; 
Provided that, this sub-rule shall not apply to direct recruitment to Group-A and Group-B 
psots; 



103 
Provided further that where on account of acquisition of any land or plot in the 
gramatana 
or other property belonging to a project displaced person, possession thereof was taken 
twenty 
years prior to the commencement of the Karnataka Civil Services (General Recruitment) 
(Fifty 
Seventh Amendment) Rules, 2000, the members of the family of such project displaced 
person 
shall not be eligible for recruitment under this sub-rule: 
Proided also that, all things being equal, direct recruitment under this sub-rule shall be 
made in the following order of preference, namely:- 
(i) the members of the family of a proejct displaced person who has lost to a project, 
his dwelling house and at least fifty percent of his agricultural land onwhich he was 
dependent; 
(ii) the members of the family of a project displaced person who was landless in the 
pre-project period, but lost his dwelling house to a project; 
(iii) the members of the family of a project displaced person who has lost to a project 
only fifty percent or less of his agricultural land on which he was dependent; 
.............. 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
M. VENKATARAMAIAH 
Under Secretary to Government-I, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 24-11-2000 
104 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
NOTIFICATION 
No. DPAR 34 SRR 2002, Bangalore, dated 2nd March, 2002 
Whereas the draft of the Karnataka Civil Services (General Recruitment) (Amendment) 
Rules, 2001, was published as required by clause (a) of sub-section (2) of section 3 read 
with 
section 8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Karnataka Act 14 of 1990) in 
Notification 
No. DPAR 25 SCR 2000, dated 11-6-2001 in part IV-A of the Karnataka Gazette Extra-
ordinary No. 
1161 dated 14th June, 2001 inviting objections and suggestions from all persons likely to 
be affected 
thereby within thirty days from the date of its publication in the Official Gazette. 
Whereas the said Gazette was made available to the public on 14th June, 2001. 
And whereas the objections and suggestions received have been considered by the 
State 
Government. 
Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of section 3 read 
with section 8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Karnataka Act 14 of 
1990), the 
Government of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules, namely :- 
RULES 
1. Title and commencement.- (1) These rules may be called as Karnataka Civil 



Services 
(General Recruitment) (fifty eighth Amendment) Rules, 2001. 
(2) They shall come into force from the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of rule 3.- In rule 3 of the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) 
Rules, 1977, after the sub-rule (2), the following shall be inserted, namely:- 
“(3) Notwithstanding anything contained in these rules or in any other rules made or 
deemed to have been made under the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 
(Karnataka Act, 
14 of 1990) maximum marks earmarked for interview, viva-voce or personality test, as 
the case 
may be, in respect of any direct recruitment shall not exceed five percent of the 
maximum marks 
specified for written competitive examination or the qualifying examination, as the case 
may be, 
and in case the maximum marks so earmarked for interview, viva-voce or personality 
test, as the 
case may be exceed the said percentage, it shall be deemed to have been reduced to 
five 
percent of the maximum marks specified for the written competitive examination or the 
qualifying 
examination, as the case may be”. 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
S. CHANDRASHEKARAPPA, 
Under Secretary to Government-I, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 4-3-2002 
105 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
NOTIFICATION 
No. DPAR 29 SRR 97, Bangalore, dated 8th April, 2002 
Whereas the draft of the following rules further to amend the Karnataka Civil Services 
(General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 was published as required by clause (a) of sub-
section (2) of 
section 3 read with section 8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Karnataka 
Act 14 of 
1990) in Notification No. DPAR 29 SRR 97, dated 9-1-2002 in part -IV of the Karnataka 
Gazette 
dated 21-2-2002 inviting objections and suggestions from persons likely to be affected 
thereby 
within thirty days from the date of the publication of the draft in the Official Gazette. 
Whereas the said draft was made available to the public on 21-2-2002. 
And whereas no objections and suggestions have been received in this behalf by the 
State 
Government. 
Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of section 3 read 
with section 8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Karnataka Act 14 of 
1990) the 
Government of Karnataka hereby make the following rules, namely :- 



Rules 
1. Title and Commencement :- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Fifty Nineth Amendment) Rules, 2002. 
(2) They shall come into force from the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of rule 13 :- In rule 13 of the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) 
Rules, 1977, for clause (i), the following shall be substituted, namely :- 
“(i) by the Commission in respect of his application and examination; 
(ia) by any other authority making direct recruitment, with the consent of the 
Government, 
in respect of his application and examination; and” 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
S. CHANDRASHEKARAPPA, 
Under Secretary to Government-I, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 24-4-2002 
106 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
NOTIFICATION 
No. DPAR 57 SRR 2001, Bangalore, dated 22nd May 2002 
Whereas the draft of the following rules further to amend the Karnataka Civil Services 
(General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 was published as required by clause (a) of sub-
section (2) of 
section 3 read with section 8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Karnataka 
Act 14 of 
1990) in Notification No. DPAR 57 SRR 2001, dated 8th April 2002, in part -IV (No. 525) 
of the 
Karnataka Gazette extra-ordinary dated 12th April, 2002 inviting objections and 
suggestions from 
persons likely to be affected thereby within thirty days from the date of the publication of 
the draft in 
the Official Gazette. 
Whereas the said draft was made available to the public on 12th April 2002. 
And whereas no objections and suggestions have been received in this behalf by the 
State 
Government. 
Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of section 3 read 
with section 8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Karnataka Act 14 of 
1990) the 
Government of Karnataka hereby make the following rules, namely :- 
Rules 
1. Title and Commencement :- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Sixtieth Amendment) Rules, 2002. 
(2) They shall come into force from the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of new rule 4A :- After rule 4 of the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) Rules, 1977, the following rules shall be inserted, namely:- 
“4A. Foregoing Promotion.- (1) A Government servant who, on promotion does not 



want 
to accept such promotion may, within fifteen days from the date of receipt of the order of 
promotion, 
make a written request seeking permission of the appointing authority to forego the 
promotion 
so made, and if on consideration or such request the reasons given for foregoing the 
promotion 
are found acceptable by the appointing authority, it may permit the Government servant 
to forego 
the same. 
(2) In all such cases of foregoing promotion by the Government servant, shall not be 
considered 
for promotion for a period of one year from the date of his request seeking permission to 
forego the promotion or till the immediate next date of consideration for promotion, 
whichever is 
later. On the eventual promotion to the igher grade, such Government servant shall lose 
seniority 
vis-a-vis his juniors promoted to the higher grade earlier, irrespective of the fact whether 
the posts 
in question are filled by selection or otherwise. 
(3) in case, where the reasons given by the Government servant for foregoing the 
promotion 
are not acceptable to the appointing Authority the same shall be communicated in writing 
to the 
concerned Government servant who shall, immediately on receipt of such 
communication, assume 
the charge of the promotional post, failing which it shall be constructed as misconduct. 
Provided that such request seeking permission to forego promotion by female 
Government 
servants shall not ordinarily be refused". 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
K.L. JAYARAM 
Under Secretary to Government-I, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 23-5-2002 
107 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
NOTIFICATION No. DPAR 71 SRR 2001, 
Bangalore, dated 24th October, 2002. 
Whereas the draft of the rules further to amend the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) Rules, 1977 was published as required by clause (a) of sub-section (2) of 
section 3 
read with section 8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Karnataka Act 14 of 
1990) in 
Notification No. DPAR 71 SRR 2001 dated 16th April, 2002 in Part-IV-A of the Karnataka 
Gazette 
Extra-ordinary No. 550 dated 18th April, 2002 inviting objections and suggestions from 
all persons 
likely to be affected thereby within thirty days from the date of its publication in the 



Official Gazette. 
Whereas the said Gazette was made available to the public on 18th April, 2002. 
And whereas the objections and suggestions received have been considered. 
Now, therefore in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of section 3 read 
with 
section 8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Karnataka Act 14 of 1990), the 
Government 
of Karnataka hereby makes the following rules, namely :- 
Rules 
1. Title and Commencement and application :- (1) These rules may be called the 
Karnataka Civil Services (General Recruitment) (Sixty First Amendment) Rules, 2002. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of rule 9:- In rule 9 of the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) 
Rules, 1977, after sub-rule (1B), the following shall be inserted, namely:- 
“(1c) Notwithstanding anything contained in the rules of recruitment specially made in 
respect of any service or post, in all direct recruitment, five percent of vacancies set 
apart for 
that method in each of the categories of General Merit, Scheduled Castes, Scheduled 
Tribes and 
in each of the Categories among other Backward Classes shall, subject to any general 
instructions 
that may be issued by the Government regarding the manner of appointment, be filled 
from 
among candidates who have studied in Kannada Medium from first standard to tenth 
standard 
where the qualifying examination prescribed for a post is S.S.L.C. or higher, or from first 
standard 
to qualifying examination where the qualifying examination prescribed for a post is lower 
than S.S.L.C.” 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
P.K. BABURAO 
Under Secretary to Government-I, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 28-10-2002 
108 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 74 SRR 2002, Bangalore, dated 29th January, 2003 
Whereas the draft of the rules further to amend the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) Rules, 1977 was published as required by clause (a) of sub-section (2) of 
section 3 
read with section 8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Karnataka Act, 14 of 
1990) in 
Notification No. DPAR 74 SRR 2002 dated 16th December, 2002 in Part-IV-A of the 
Karnataka 
Gazette Extra-ordinary No. 1665 dated 17th December, 2002 inviting objections and 
suggestions 
from all persons likely to be affected thereby within thirty days from the date of its 



publication in the 
Official Gazette. 
Whereas the said Gazette was made available to the public on 17th December, 2002. 
And whereas no objections or suggestions have been received by the State 
Government. 
Now, therefore in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of section 3 read 
with 
section 8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Karnataka Act 14 of 1990), the 
Government 
of Karnataka hereby make the following rules, namely :- 
Rules 
1. Title and Commencement :- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Sixty Second Amendment) Rules, 2003. 
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of Rule 5 :- In rule 5 of the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) 
Rules, 1977, in sub-rule (5), for the words “fourth standard” the words “seventh 
standard” shall be 
substituted. 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
P.K. BABURAO 
Under Secretary to Government-I, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 30-1-2003 
109 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification, 
No. DPAR 86 SRR 2002, Bangalore, Dated 4th September, 2003 
Whereas the draft of the Karnataka Civil Servies (General Recruitment) (........... 
Amendment) 
Rules, 2003 was published as required by clause (a) of sub-section (2) of section 3 read 
with section 8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Karnataka Act 14 of 
1990), in 
Notification No. DPAR 86 SRR 2002 dated 16-6-2003 in Part-IV-A of the Karnataka 
Gazette Extraordinary 
No. 723 dated 30th June, 2003 inviting objections and suggestions from persons likely to 
be affected thereby within fifteen days from the date of its publication of the draft in the 
Official 
Gazette. 
Whereas, the said Gazette was made available to the public on 30th June, 2003. 
And whereas no objections and suggestions have been received by the State 
Government. 
Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of section 3 read 
with section 8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Karnataka Act 14 of 
1990), the 
Government of Karnataka makes the following rules namely :- 
Rules 
1. Title and Commencement :- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 



Services 
(General Recruitment) (Sixty third Amendment) Rules, 2003. 
(2) They shall come into force from the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of rule 9 :- In rule 9 of the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) 
Rules, 1977 :- 
“(i) In sub-rule (1A), the third proviso shall be omitted. 
ii) In sub-rule (2) after the words “in sub-rule (1)”, the words, brackets, letter and figures” 
and sub-rule (1A)” shall be inserted”. 
By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
P.K. BABURAO 
Under Secretary to Government-I, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 15-9-2003 
110 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 111 SRR 2002, Bangalore, dated 3rd February, 2004 
Whereas the draft of the following Rules further to amend the Karnataka Civil Services 
(General Recruitment) Rules, 1977, was published as required by clause (a) of sub-
section 2 of 
section 3 read with section 8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Karnataka 
Act 14 of 
1990) in Notification No. DPAR 111 SRR 2002, dated 29th November, 2003 in Part-IV-A 
(No. 1462) 
of the Karnataka Gazette Extra-ordinary dated 2nd December, 2003 inviting objections 
and suggestions 
from persons likely to be affected thereby within fifteen days from the date of publication 
of the 
draft in the Official Gazette. 
Whereas the said Gazette was made available to the public on 2nd December, 2003. 
And whereas no objections and suggestions have been received by the State 
Government. 
Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of the Section (3) 
read with Section 8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Karnataka Act 14 of 
the 1990) 
the Government of Karnataka make the following rules, namely :- 
Rules 
1. Title and Commencement :- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (Sixty fourth Amendment) Rules, 2004. 
(2) These rules shall be deemed to have come into force with effect from the Eleventh 
day 
of November, 1998. 
3. Amendment of rule 2 :- The clause (mm) of sub-rule (1) of rule 2 of the Karnataka 
Civil 
Services (General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 (hereinafter referred to as said rules) shall 
be omitted. 
4. Omission of rule 3B :- Rule 3 B of the said rules shall be omitted. 



By Order and in the name of the 
Governor of Karnataka, 
P.K. BABURAO 
Under Secretary to Government-I, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms, 
(Service Rules). 
Published in Gazette dated 21-2-2004 
111 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 147 SRR 2004, Bangalore, dated 25th July, 2005 
Whereas, the draft of the following Rules further to amend the Karnataka Civil Services 
(General Recruitment) Rules, 1977 was published as required by clause (a) of sub-
section (2) of 
Section 3 read with section 8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Karnataka 
Act 14 of 
1990), in Notification No. DPAR 147 SRR 2004, dated 17th June, 2005 in Part-IV-A (No. 
1178 )of the 
Karnataka Gazette Extra-ordinary dated 17th June, 2005 inviting objections and 
suggestions from 
persons likely to be affected thereby within fifteen days from the date of publication of 
draft in the 
Official Gazette. 
Whereas, the said Gazette was made available to the public on 17th June, 2005. 
And, whereas no objections and suggestions have been received by the State 
Government. 
Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of section 3 read 
with section 8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Karnataka Act 14 of 
1990), the 
Government of Karnataka makes the following rules, namely :- 
Rules 
1. Title and Commencement :- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (65th Amendment) Rules, 2005. 
(2) These shall come into force from the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of rule 16-A :- In the Karnataka Civil Services (General Recruitment) 
Rules, 
1977, for the Rule 16-A, the following shall be substituted :- 
“16A. Appointment by transfer within the service :- Notwithstanding anything 
contained 
in these rules or the rules of recruitment specially made in respect of any service or post, 
a Head of 
the Department in respect of a service may in public interest and for reasons to be 
recorded in 
writing and subject to any general instructions that may be issued by Government in this 
behalf 
appoint by transfer a member of a Group -C or Group - D service from a post in one unit 
of seniority 
to an identical post in the same cadre in another unit of seniority. 
Provided that such appointment by transfer shall not be made more than once in the 
service 



of a Government Servant. 
Explanation :- (1) “Unit of Seniority” means the Jurisdiction of the appointing authority in 
respect of a post. 
(2) Such transfer shall not be permissible from one cadre to another cadre. 
By order and in the name of the Governor of Karnataka 
P.K. Baburao 
Under Secretary to Government-1, 
Department of Personnel and Administrative Reforms 
(Service Rules). 
112 
DEPARTMENT OF PERSONNEL AND ADMINISTRATIVE REFORMS 
Notification 
No. DPAR 50 SRR 2000, Bangalore, Dated : 3rd September, 2005 
Whereas, the draft of the following Rules further to amend the Karnataka Civil Services 
(General Recruitment) Rules,1977 was published as required by clause (a) of sub-
section (2) of 
section 3 read with section 8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Karnataka 
Act 14 of 
1990), in Notification No. DPAR 50 SRR 2000, dated 17th August, 2005 in Part IV-A 
(No.1591) of the 
Karnataka Gazette Extra-ordinary dated 17th August, 2005 inviting objections and 
suggestions from 
persons likely to be affected thereby within fifteen days from the date of publication of 
draft in the 
Official Gazette. 
Whereas, the said Gazette was made available to the public on 17th August, 2005. 
And, whereas no objections and suggestions have been received by the State 
Government. 
Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of section 3 read 
with 
section 8 of the Karnataka State Civil Services Act, 1978 (Karnataka Act 14 of 1990), the 
Government 
of Karnataka makes the following rules, namely:- 
RULES 
1.Title and commencement .- (1) These rules may be called the Karnataka Civil 
Services 
(General Recruitment) (66th Amendment) Rules, 2005. 
(2) They shall come into force from the date of their publication in the Official Gazette. 
2. Amendment of rule 2 .- In rule 2 of the Karnataka Civil Services (General 
Recruitment) 
Rules, 1977 (hereinafter referred to as said rules), in sub-rule (1), for clause (ll), the 
following shall 
be substituted, namely :- 
“(ll) “Physically handicapped candidate” or “Person with disability” means a person 
suffering 
from not less than forty percent of any of the following disabilities as certified by a 
medical authority, 
namely :- 
(i) blindness 
(ii) low vision 
(iii) leprosy cured 



(iv) hearing impairment 
(v) locomotor disability 
(vi) mental retardation 
(vii) mental illness 
113 
Explanation .- 
(a) Blindness refers to a condition where a person suffers from any of the following 
conditions, 
namely :- 
(I) total absence of sight; or 
(ii) visual acuity not exceeding 6/60 or 20/200 (snellen) in the better eye with correcting 
lenses; or 
(iii) limitation of the field of vision subtending an angle of 20 degree or worse; 
(b) Person with low vision means a person with impairment of visual functioning even 
after 
treatment or standard refractive correction but who uses or is potentially capable of 
using vision for 
the planning or execution of a task with appropriate assistive device; 
(c) Leprosy cured means any person who has been cured of leprosy but is suffering 
from, - 
(i) loss of sensation in hands or feet as well as loss of sensation and paresis in the 
eye and eye-lid but with no manifest deformity; 
(ii) manifest deformity and paresis but having sufficient mobility in their hands 
and feet to enable them to engage in normal economic activity; 
(iii) extreme physical deformity as well as advanced age which prevents him 
from undertaking any gainful occupation; 
and the expression “leprosy cured” shall be construed accordingly. 
(d) “Hearing impairment” means loss of sixty decibels or more in the better ear in the 
conversational 
range of frequencies. 
(e) “Locomotor disability” means disability of the bones, joints or muscles leading to 
substantial 
restriction of the movement of the limbs or any form of cerebral palsy. 
(f) “mental retardation” means a condition of arrested or incomplete development of mind 
of 
a person who is specially characterised by sub normality of intelligence; 
(g) “mental illness” means any mental disorder other than mental retardation. 
3. Amendment of rule 9 .- In rule 9 of the said rules,- 
(1) for sub-rule (1A), except the provisos, the following shall be substituted, namely :- 
“(1A) Notwithstanding anything contained in the rules of recruitment specially made in 
respect 
of any service or post, if in such rules of recruitment, direct recruitment is prescribed as 
one of the 
114 
methods of recruitment, the following percentage of the vacancies set apart for that 
method in 
each of the categories of General merit, Scheduled Castes and Scheduled Tribes and in 
each of 
the categories among other Backward Classes shall be reserved for, and shall be filled 
by direct 
recruitment from among the candidates who are physically handicapped, namely :- 



(i) three percent of the vacancies in Group-”A” or Group-”B” posts as may be identified 
and notified by the Government. 
(ii) five percent of the vacancies in Group-”C” or Group-”D” posts as may be identified 
and notified by the Government. 
(2) clause (i) of the first proviso to sub-rule (1A) shall be omitted. 
By Order and in the name of the Governor of Karnataka, 
P.K. BABU RAO 
Under Secretary to Government, 
Department of Personnel & Administrative Reforms 
(Service Rules-1) 
¾{êË©µâdâpâ°, Àâ°°{âZx, Èê©Ù}â ÉÖÀâ°ÐZ Àâ°yâ°K ~âZdârÇêgâÔâ EÈÖfê, ÏêªgâÔâ³pâ° dÖ.Éâ³. 4344 
 


